January 23, 2013

Board of County Commnussioners

Agenda , ;
R . . Charfes Eaton, Chaw  District 117
5:00 P.M. Busmess_ Meeting / Public Alicra Aguilar, Vice-Chawr District [T
i Hearzng . Mary Andersen District T
Valencia County Commission Cliambers Lawrence R Romero Disirict 11
444 Luna Avenue Donald Holliday District 11

Los Lunas, NM 87031
T = = e

1) Call Meeting to Order

2) Pledge of Allegiance

3) Approval of Agenda

4) Approval of Minutes:
December 5, 2012... Business Meeting
January 2, 2012....... Business Meeting

DISCUSSION (Non-Action) ITEM(S)

5) Reports from Commissions, Boards and Committees.

PUBLIC HEARING ITEM(S)

6) Consideration of location transfer of Liquor License 0510/Application No. A-838648 from 2765 State Highway
47, Los Lunas NM 87031 to proposed focation of 3409 State Highway 47, Suite A, Los Lunas NM 87031.

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS CONVENES AS INDIGENT CLAIMS BOARD

7) Consideration of the Indigent Report 40 claims and 3 Indigent Claims. Barbara Baker / Dan Zolnier

BOARD RE-CONVENES AS BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

ACTION ITEM(S)

8) Consideration to accept Application No. A-838648 for location transfer of Liquor License 0510 from 2765 State
Highway 47, Los Lunas, NM 87031 to proposed location of 3409 State Highway 47, Suite A, Los Lunas NM
87031. Peggy Carabajal

9) Consideration to accept Resolution No. 2013- , Public Notice describing Procedures to Inspect Public
Records.

10) Consideration for a request to Pubiish Ordinance No. 2013- , adopting the 2006 Edition of the
International Fire Code, Steve Gonzales

FINANCIAL MATTERS:

B: 074 P: 436
1) Approval of FinancialfPayroll warrants. Nick Telles | it byl bk ot/ AV VST B 10

PUBLIC COMMENT:

Please sign up on the sheet located just outside the Commission chambers. The Board will allow each member of the
public wishing to address the Board a full and complete opportunity to address the Commission.

Page 1 of 2



EXECUTIVE SESSION:

Pursuant to Section 10-15 1 (H) (2) (7) & (8), the following matters may be discussed in closed session: a. personnel:
b. pending or threatened litigation: Selid Waste Protest; Barela vs. BOCC c. real property: d. other specific limited
topics that are allowed or authorized under the stated statute.

Motion and rol call vote to go into Executive Session for the stated reasons

Board meets in closed session

Motion and vote to go back into regular session

Summary of itemns discussed in closed session

Motion and roll call vote that matters discussed in closed session were limited to those specified in motion
for closure, and that no final action was taken, pursuant to the authority in §10-15-§ NMSA 1978.

S O O & o

ACTION ITEMS:

12) Delegation of Settlement Authority to County Manager for Barela v. BOCC

13) Instruct Purchasing Agent on Issuance of Protest Determination.

NEXT COMMISSION MEETING:

¢ February 6, 2013 — Business Mecting @ 5:00 P.M.
Valencia County Commission Board Room 444 Luna Ave. LL, NM

ADJOURN:

If you are an individual with a disability who is in need of a reader. amplifier, qualified sign language
interpreter, or any other form of auxiliary aid or service to attend or participate in the hearing or meeting,
please contact the Valencia County Manager's Office at the Valencia County Courthouse, Los Lunas, New
Mexico, (505) 866-2014 at least one week prior to the meeting or as soon as possible. Public documents,
including the agenda and minutes. can be provided in various accessible formats. Please contact the
Valencia County Manager’s Office at the old Valencia County Courthouse if a summary or other lype of
accessible format is needed.

B: 074 P: 437
R B R LB ST, B

Page 2 of 2



Page 1 of b

VALENCIA COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
BUSINESS / PUBLIC MEETING

JANUARY 23, 2013

PRESENT ABSENT
Charles Eaton, Chairman
Alicia Aguilar, Vice-Chair

Lawrence Romero, Member

Donald E. Holliday, Member

Mary J. Andersen, Member

Bruce Swingle, County Manager

Adren Nance & Dave Pato, County Attorneys
Peggy Carabajal, County Clerk

Press and Public

1) The meeting was called to order by Chairman Eaton at 5:00 P,M.

2) Fire Chief Steven Gonzales led the Pledge of Allagiance.

3) Approval of Agenda
Commissioner Andersen moved for approval of the agenda. Seconded by Commissioner
Aguilar. Motion carried unanimousiy.

4) Approval of Minutes: December 19, 2012 Business Meeting
Commissioner Holliday moved for approval of the minutes. Seconded by Commissioner
Andersen. Motion carried unanimously.

January 2, 2013 Business Meeting
Commissioner Andersen stated that a correction needed to be made in the section of
minutes regarding the Planning and Zoning Board appointments. Commissioner
Andersen’s and Commissioner Romero’s appointees need to be reversed. The minutes
should read Commissioner Andersen will retain Gregory Gaudette and Commissioner
Romero will retain Joan Artiaga.
Commissioner Andersen moved for approval of the corrected minutes. Seconded by
Commissioner Aguilar. Motion carried unanimously.

DISCUSSION (NON-ACTION) ITEM(S)

5) Reports from Commissions, Boards, and Committees.

Commissioner Andersen said there was an article published in the News-Bulletin iast
week while she was out of town; therefore she was not able to respond to the reporter.
The article quoted the Planning Officer from the City of Belen as saying that she had
personally given him permission to take whatever action they were reporting.
Commissioner Andersen wants it recorded that she did not do such a thing. She “finds it
incredible that Mr. Tomita would make such a statement, i am sure he is just as aware as |
am that | have no such authority.”

Commissioner Aguilar stated she had also read the article and thanked Commissioner
Andersen for the clarification, knowing her as she does, Commissioner Aguilar did not
think that the information regarding Commissioner Andersen was accurate.

Commissioner Aguilar stated that they had received ietters from the Village of Los Lunas
requesting to come before the County Commission at the meeting on February 20, the
village would like to present information on what they are doing in Los Lunas.
Commissioner Aguilar asked that the Commissioners would allow this and look at it as a
positive thing as there are two entities vying for a hospital and it is a good thing to listen
to both and if the City of Beien would like to come forth and present information at the
same meeting she said it would be great. The public has a lot of questions and they would
appreciate the facts being presented to them.

Commissioner Aguilar stated that she had received numerous calis regarding the Solid
Waste Contract, there were some questions that she was unable to answer: she would
like time in today’s meeting where some of these questions could be answered accurately
so as to put a stop to some of the rumors and incorrect information. Commissioner
Holliday asked if the Commission was prepared to answer the questions, do they have all
the facts in front of them. County Attorney Nance stated he did not know the content of all
of the questions that are going to be asked. Some of the questions directly regarding the

B: 074 P: 438
B T 1, T




Page 2 of 5
Minutes of January 23, 2013 Business/Public Meeting

protest, which is in Executive Session, possibly might not be answered until the protest is
resolved. Other questions they may be able to discuss depending on the content and as to
where they were at in the procurement process.

County Manager Bruce Swingle said he had a recent meeting with the Village of Los
Lunas. Some of the Commissioners had expressed questions regarding the hospital, Los
Lunas’s role in the hospital and the GRT associated with the hospital administration. The
Village of Los Lunas, made it very clear that they had sent a communication to the Miller
Group to get a personal response from him. The first question asked was /s it possible for
Miller to move the proposed hospital from Los Lunas to any other site in Valencia County?
The answer was no, based on their research there is no other site which would
accommodate a successful hospital.

The second question being If the hospital remained in Los Lunas could they open an
office in another jurisdiction outside of Los Lunas would they take the GRT with them?
The answer being, the hospitai is designed with the administrative headquarters at the
hospital, so where the hospital is built is where the GRT will rest.

Commissioner Holliday has a case in his district where there is a gentleman who had a
fire on his property, this gentieman is ill and broke, He has been cited over and over again
in regards to needing to have his yard cieaned up, The gentleman is unable to do this task
himself. Commissioner Holliday spoke to Code Enforcement Officer Sonny Vega who
assured him that the gentleman is indeed very ill and not abie to personally ciean the
yard. Commissioner Holliday gets phone calls a few times a week from people wandering
when this property will be cleaned up. He asked if the county has anything in place for
nardship cases like this gentleman’s. County Manager Swingle stated that we cannot as a
governmental entity provide the service, but we do have outside resources that will be
able to step in and provide the needed services. Mr. Swingle asked that he be provided
with the gentleman’s information and he will make arrangements for the matter to be
taken care of. Chairman Eaton aiso stated that since there had been a fire on the
property Chief Gonzales from the Fire Department might aiso be able to provide a helpful
avenue with the Red Cross.

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS CONVENES AS PUBLIC HEARING BOARD
Commissioner Holliday motioned to convene as Public Hearing Board. Commissioner
Andersen seconded the moation. Motion carried unanimously.

SWEARING IN OF PARTICIPANTS
County Clerk Peggy Carabajal administered the oath to those individuals wishing to give
testimony at tonight’s meeting.

PUBLIC HEARING ITEM(S)

6) Consideration of location transfer of the Liguor License 0510/Application No, A-
838648 from 2765 St. Hwy 47, Los Lunas NM 87031 to proposed location of 3409 St.
Hwy 47 Suite A, Los Lunas, NM 87031. (See Exhibit A)

Mark Rhodes accompanied by his business partner Mark Garcia spoke in regards to them
wanting this transfer, not for opening a bar but for the purpose of opening a package
liquor store.

Valencia County residents making public comments at today’s meeting were

Voil Lattin, Marjorie Wong, Glen Rael, Pastor Jim Montoya, and Daniel Aragon speaking
on behalf of Patricia Garduno and Catherine Garduno,

These residents expressed their objection to the transfer of the liquor license. Some of
the issues they brought up were that there are several churches in close proximity to the
proposed location, toe much traffic for such a small space, questionable characters
loitering around and disturbing property, fear of theft or burglary by individuals trying to
get money to buy the alcohol, having children from a nearby school exposed to the
alcohol,

BOARD RE-CONVENES AS BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
Commissioner Andersen motioned to re-convene as Board of County Commissioners.
Seconded by Commissioner Aguilar. Motion carried unanimousiy.

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS CONVENES AS INDIGENT CLAIVIS BOARD
Commissioner Andersen motioned to convene as indigent Claims Board. Seconded by
Commissioner Aguilar. Motion carried unanimously.

B: 074 P: 439
11 T T AL B L 0 10




FPage d of b
Minutes of January 23, 2013 Business/Public Meeting

7) Consideration of the Indigent Report 40 ciaims and 3 Indigent Appeals -Barbara
Baker

County Manager Bruce Swingle represented Barbara Baker who was out sick. Mr.
Swingle presented the Indigent Claims from December 6, 2012- January 3, 2013 and

requested approval of $39,901.36 o
Commissioner Holliday motioned for approval of the claims. Seconded by Commissioner

Andersen. Motion carried unanimously. (See gxhibit B}

Mr. Swingle presented an Indigent Appeal for Thomas Byrns in the amount of $3,229.26 to
be paid to Presbyterian Hospital. (See Exhibit C)
Mr. Swingle presented an indigent Appeal for lvan Garcia in the amount of $382.00 to be
paid to Albuquerque Health Partners. (See Exhibit D}
Mr Swingle presented an indigent Appeal for Jeanette Laurel in the amount of $1156.00 to
be paid to Lovelace Medical Center. {See Exhibit E)

Commissioner Holliday motioned for approval of the three Indigent Appeals. Seconded by
Commissioner Aguilar. Motion carried unanimously.

BOARD RE-CONVENES AS BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
Commissioner Holliday motioned to re-convene as the Board of County Commissioners.
Seconded by Commissioner Andersen. Motion carried unanimously.

ACTION ITEM(S)

8) Consideration to accept Application No. A-838648 for location transfer of Liquor
License 0510 from 2765 St. Hwy 47 Los Lunas, NM 87031 to proposed location of 3409
St. Hwy 47, Suite A, Los Lunas, NM 87031~ Peggy Carabajal

Commissioner Holliday motioned to deny the application. Motion seconded by
Commissioner Aguilar. Discussion by commissioners included Commissioner Aguilar
commenting that she motioned for denial based on the reasoning that a local Pastor had
testified tonigit that his and other churches were in such close proximity to the proposed
focation. Alse no proof such as a plot plan or a legal description properly identifying the
property was provided to the commissioners. Nor was anything provided showing a
proper split of the property. Commissioner Aguilar is definitely concerned about the
health, safety and welfare of the community. Motion carried unanimously. { (See Exhibit F} )

9) Consideration to accept Resolution No. 2013-08, Public Notice describing
Procedures to Inspect Public Records

Commissioner Andersen motion for approval of the resolution. Seconded by
Commissioner Aguilar. Motion carried unanimously.

County Clerk Peggy Carabajal announced Resolution 2013-08.  (See Exhibit G)

10) Consideration for a request to Publish Ordinance No. 2013-01, adopting the 2006
Edition of the International Fire Code - Steven Gonzales

Commissioner Andersen motioned for approval. Commissioner Aguilar seconded the
motion. Motion carried unanimously.

County Clerk Peggy Carabajal announced Ordinance 2013-01.  (See Exhibit H)

FINANCIAL MATTERS;

11) Approval of Financial/lPayroll Warrants- Nick Telles

Accounts payable warrants in the amount of $374,630.68. Payroll in the amount of
$413,782.29

Commissioner Andersen motioned for approval. Seconded by Commissioner Holiiday.

. arri , .
Motion carried unanimously (See Exhibit 1. &,LM)

PUBLIC COMMENT:

Valencia County residents making pubfic comments at today’s meeting were

Sharon Honeycutt, Jay Kortsch, Floyd Mullins, Ernie Byers, Judy Catuccio, Lee Davis,
Karen Trujillo-Sutall, Dorothy Truijillo, Victor Sanchez

These residents expressed their opposition to the Solid Waste contract. Some of the
concerns voiced by the residents included, a giant corporation like Waste Management
will not care about the citizens, current WM customers are not satisfied with the
company’s customer service, having this contract will not solve the issue of illegal

~B: 074 P: 440
I T B ML P, B




Page 4 of b

Minutes of January 23, 2013 Business/Public Meeting

dumping of particular items, concerned about liens being placed on their property, not
being able to afford the service, feeling like control is being taken away from the citizens
by not having their own free will to choose whomever they want to pick up their trash, the
contract may also putlocal trash haulers out of business,

Frank Santiago with Waste Management stated that change is always a difficult thing and
with change there will always be some dissatisfaction, but WM wants to satisfy their
customers and by looking at the overall majority of WM customers they are highly
satisfied with the company’s service.

Chairman Eaton asked the County Manager to give a brief summary on as to how the RFP
process originated to where we are today.

Charles Montoya from a trash hauling business stated that they did not place a bid
because they looked at the RFP and they could not see it working in regards to how much
delinquency they foresee from residents unwilling or not able to pay.

Randy Sanchez from a trash hauling business stated that he submitted a bid for the
contract but he was not able to provide a bond that was required for the process, his bid
was thrown out.

Commissioner Aguilar said she had received a phone call from Paul Alexander. Mr.
Alexander was a member of the Solid Waste Committee, one of his comments was that the
sontract should have been a utility bid. He felt that the RFP was good, but was just the
wrong item,

Commissioner Andersen stated that with her years of experience in purchasing she feels
that Mr. Vinyard did everything correctly and fully believes that everything done was in
accordance with the Procurement Code and the laws of New Mexico.

Chairman Eaton asked Purchasing Director Michae! Vinyard if there was a scoring format
that was established for the evaluation committee. Mr. Vinyard stated that yes there was
one; it was built into the RFP. The format was stated right up front as to how the format
was to work. It was specified clearly what areas were to be evaluated.

EXECUTIVE SESSION:

Pursuant to Section 10-15-1 (H) (2) (7) & (8) the following matters may be discussed in
closed session; a) Personnel b) Pending or threatened litigation: Solid Waste Protest:
Barela vs. BOCC c) real property d) other specific limited topics that are allowed or
authorized under the stated statute.

Commissioner Aguilar moved to go into Executive Session. Commissioner Andersen
seconded the motion. Motion carried unanimousiy.

Commissioner Aguilar motioned to go back into Regular Session. Seconded by
Commissioner Holliday. Motion carried unanimously.

County Attorney Adren Nance stated matters that were discussed in Executive Session
were limited to the items listed on the agenda, which were consideration of Solid Waste
Protest ancl Barela vs. BOCC.

Commissioner Aguilar motioned to approve the summary as stated by counsel. Seconded
by Commissioner Andersen .

ACTION ITEMS:

12) Delegation Of Settlement Authority to County Manager for Barela vs. BOCC
Commissioner Holliday motioned for approval. Seconded by Commissioner Andersen.
Motion carried unanimously.

13) Instruct Purchasing Agent On Issuance of Protest Determination

According to County Attorney Pato the board will have the Purchasing Agent issue the
determination as provided by the procurement code. No action by the boardi is required.
Even though no voting action was required by the board, Commissioner Aguilar and
Chairman Eaton stated that if action from them had been required they would have
abstained from the vote because they have questions regarding this issue and weren’t
part of the RFP process that was taken before they came aboard.

B: 074 P: 441
) BT AR B AT 1 B

1




Page b of 5
Minutes of January 23, 2013 Business/Pubiic Meeting
11) Adjournment

Commissioner Andersen moved for adjournment. Seconded by Commissioner Aguilar
Motion carried unanimously. TIME: 9:04 P.M.

NGTE: All proposals, documents, items, etc., pertaining to items on the agenda of the
January 23, 2013 Business/Public Hearing Meeting (presented to the Board of County
Commissioners) are attached in consecutive order as stated in these minutes.

VALENC OUNTY BOA COMMISSIONERS

/.’“/?/

(e C

CiA AGU/ /-—CHAKR
)r,'/:’.p‘*‘" ]{ ﬁ‘[

Eled e

LAWRENCE R. ROMERO, MEMBER
A
/g‘vl/ [{7&1—6(/—:4
o /PONALDE %LL!DA{Y MEMBER
C/"//g_éi; v .-":?/ T A
IVIAR/YJ ANDERSEN MEMBER
‘/
ATTEST
Q" re 5éGYuAR)xBﬂJAr€oumYCLERK
a
ENY ’Z;Jozd 20/7
~ DATE_ =
b R
oo "

5: 074 P: 442
AT i B L B




Eacddy romang paagaddesyq ™ pasoiddy

ol VARV

V)
oL, 7 aummidig) &/ \\‘ § \ MU0 AunoD \ pasolddesiq pasorddy :sue pays
LR mmmuxm EEHS 32 fuo pjay Swimay (Kunon u. 2P 4 (v g ;Jo Apog Sufiaaen [Eao]
S waN 10 ajesg (A _\N\ L

s — Farndxg uoisspuO) £ L = - s[qng Amio
. .J\Q\W\N.___\m 1% UOISS) DA P m\\ \ITM\F | nand N
WLy Y Aq oT’ _AATT S Jo Lep Tl oud Iojag 0L, zm& QZ«. aq3drdosans

: R CI O wossnonand timont 71 wb!
A A NEWa PR w \

\Z 1 Jr ] 1 | aeq %\,\\\é% Ké \\ wpanpdddy jo ainmeusig

‘aipgnd dvpou-p fo 2oussasd Y it uliof sty afop pup 18 s n.

"SI AUB JB.pIN0ASI 3¢ 01.95U501 21)) 35IED ABOI 10 SSUIV]| Y MIUIL L0 SISS] 03 SSIJaI ABI JOI0B2IP ALY 9S[E] 3G 0) puno] 2xe dlaan suonmussardol Jo sluswaiels Aue 3|
181f). (5)2018a {s)juuayddy “onn sIv PALTEIUGD UJBIA SJURILOT D1 SMOLY ‘SUIES Y} pear ey oys /oy Jud) ‘uopeagidde sip axpw o1 jueoyjdde oy £q pazuoyine st 1o yemdde ag 51 Uy ey isAus pus sasndap

y1E0 vedn woms ANp sy Sutag s a,__; TW {omy) = ¢ ~NTY Ty & \v‘ EM& {owmu urd) 4
2} pie 1quInu asusoy) 2ald s34 ] - O 53, (uopeso] pasodord au 18 pasuadsip Fuiaq Appuesina solfesoaaq ajjoyoaie ary
p q | ¥ ON 1
FUWEIT] ratlh oW TAL N1
NUTSIR OV I e o F0T28 TN *subasubugpy * AN - pAIg sewo 1081 is52.1ppe Sulptepy
! {apod diz pue ‘0ig1s ‘Aurod pur A1o ‘pRol ojels 7 2equinu Aemydn] / 2quunu 13508 dpnjauf)
< 4 p ; UROD puE q
= 2102 1 % ADN ,“ T£0L8 0OIXAT{ MON] *A1uUn0y) ROUAE A ‘sEUNT S0 Y NG 1§ LemyBip a1eig gopg PO o 0F SIISOR| 23YM HOLED) 1esiyg
.vﬂn == ._ﬂ_ﬂ Nm.mm T 9% ot “.mumw. 3d pasUasy 10] JIUING SHEY] sioubry djumory rauaqe 4 -PAST 24 0) 3INU V/g/q
w T TRARS S — .
: : FLOCDHG-COC FOTLR AN ..2;&3:?5—4. ' AN PAJE sewe] 10RT "] tsesuaor] ac:EH ODIXAJY map 122
8780-LFE S0¢ FOT.8 IEN ‘onbranbuqry “ g N pAlg sewoT 1021 "TT 2Aua A asuaarT Lo eusr g
HAGWON INOHITTIL (drz *a3E3s “A312 Foypnpaun) SSAHAXY (renpiatpur 10 Aueduros) EINVOITALY 40 T VN
X Ausduro) Ayjqery paywrg {panwry 1o @iauan) dysisnmg voimodior) [eapatpuy i8) yoeagd
o) papidde Buiag asusor yood£1 =TT T asIdal] MAN INSS)
RO Ty uomo0T sl uofede pUR difjsiaumg Jagsuery T asue0s] FunsiNg Jo digstewa g Jogstma], T iojaedi/asa g0 Jo o3imyny T Haog Jo a3umyD) 110) Kt uopwINAdy
1£0.8 IN “FRUWT S0 ‘2 f AUAYSIH ajuig gg)y  SPIPPY RSB ALy {osn @ny) vondo ooy
slonbry Ajunoy) wpuaqey  FWEN V/B/QIUIN) Mm ﬁ QNM wm . quny wopnagddy
YT RIS A SSUAITT AJUNOT) BIDWA[ER 4 A5UTNT SUNSIXE JO SunO pIoaTy 0120 # 9523t tonbyy simg

% "SjqEPLUNY2I-UOU 1T S7 () (ITS - 247 Lonealddy

_ 3] NOILLVOI'IddV HSNIDIT 400011
.\QW@”J# ..m\ug 8

i romee st fong) B e §L84-9LY (50€) « GETLE OINIP AIN ‘3L WIEG » PEOW BOIIIIND (557

E Jaqaofy « 3oemiredacy Suisuasyy pue nonemIsy oo MIN
[ L e b SR NNt N (1

evy 'd v.0 '8

T1/z0 Y




1V 30 ) AR e S Ll
vy :d ¥.0 -8

"§0S.L8 ORI MON 2] MITEG ‘PUOY SO[ILLIAT) OSST ‘MOISIALG FUTLIBG) pUE OTOI[Y 31 01 WIOJ S{Y) LInioy

(Ay109ds) 1oty 12109 Joensowy X £193010) 930 JUEINEISoy T eBunon
uonutad( jo edA], '8
OUTISIP 197D O} FUIMOYS DRI ASAINS B-030]dWI0d JSALL I0ADAINS POSUIDL] JO JoOUIBUS POIISIARI B 993] (0% UBYY E59] INQq G99] (0F PUOASQ ST QOUMIRID O I ..

‘seswend Jo 98mooy arenbs |moy oy Spnjouf I5NW pUY FIYSLI [ 1 X % Q-uely Jo819] oU 2q pmoys wejd JooyJ oy ], ‘sastwasd Pasuaol] oy aq [[IM SILT, 'S[[EM
JoLIa)y pie ‘sinop "SJTeAA IOLI3]XO MO *PoUMSU0D L0 Plos 9 {Jim §9TBI0AIQ SHOYOD]E ATayM (s0011) 1231 Yors 107 wed 100[ PS[EIAP At Yaays serdas 7 uo ‘YSBY ),

'(s1401Q) asvq avloq Aty uolwey) ‘(0pIogoitreyy) aseg 2010 Iy UEWO[[OR :
"(sa0n)y se]) SBuey ofIsSIAL SPURg any A ‘(nbianbuq(y) osBg 6010 1y PIENIN :el0-aJo110 ‘UoRR|RISUT ARIUA JO SUEN SO T €5 sayy, |

(*eoum)stp Jsaptoys-sastwaid pasuso| o). UoHelfeISUr Areyrjin 30 suy Apado1]), uoljejrelsur Arejiji Wwolj asuBisiy "9

TE€0L8 AN "SBMT 507 “proy AS[EA URG 9 [00YIS JO WONBIOY/SSAUPPY ~ L1njuaa]y ZopuriLia,] [oTHE([100Y0S JO allfeN sorar ¢+ w0 YO9J/SOfIAl

(aoue)sIp 3sapIoys—ssstiuard pasuadlf o} [ooYss Jo auny Auodold), [0ONDS 15aTesU UG Q2UBISK] "§

T20L8 EZ “se] 5077 * L1 Aemudrg paee YOINYD JO UOIIEIO]/SSAUPPY dn[smoa ] oonts YYD JO UmN — Safim 77 B0 103)/SOlI
*(eoueysIp 3sap10ys—sasiaud pasuadyy o) Yonyo 3o surj Auadoly), YOITIYD 1S91BSU IO SOUR)SI(T ‘p

‘Buruoz ou sy aletl Suyesipul JusunLsAoS oo wWoy uoREULUOS YoENE ‘Fuioz ou S| sy J] “uoneso| pasodord

18 PaMo|[B 21E:525RIDAS] S1[0Y0D B IsIfaYM unes ‘ouoz Jo ad4) pue ssaIppe uoneso] Sulalg JUSUNLIBAOT [E00] WOl JUSM)TS Fulttoz ome ‘pauoz st sasuwaid 5y) Jy

—— APYSIA  frranwag) o9 Yoig N \sD (1-D s1durexs) pavoz st UONEIO] SISIIAL] '€
NOICIANL AR A vy 2 oo
\ TRV “ asea Jo wue) puE AL ‘g

(S)Heumo 'y

:3urmojtoy o ayeapu; eorjddy Aq paumo jou are Suip[ing pue pue| sul Jf °Z

(sjrysp spraoxd) rouy ~ (ases} Jo pasp yo Adoo yowye) Jueoyddy £q pases < juenjddy Aq paumo

)

:(2uo Yoayo) sl sasiwaid pasusaly o aq 0) pasodord st ysiym Juip[ing pue pue] o |

oI-ge-ge-s85
NOILLIINDSTA ANV ‘dTHSTYANAMO ‘NOILVI0'T SESHATAJ

TL/Z0 AT TTHETSITITPIEGE o S65b-0Lb {505) XTY x SLBE-OLb (505) » SOGLY 03JXIP AN '3 TINES w PTOY SO[[IIISD) §55T

79923 B0IIATY FUTIES PUE [0Y0I[Y » Jeawiredsq Sutenoor] put vogemSay oopy MaN




January 16, 2013

Valencia County Indigent & Insurance

BARBARA A. BAKER, ADMINISTRATOR

Post Office Box 1119 - Los Lunas, New Mexico 87031
Phone ' (505) 866-2020 - Fax: (505) 866-3366

Dear Commissioners,

1 would like to present the Indigent Claims from December 6, 2012 to January 3, 2013. The
number of claims submitted is $597.484.66. 1ask the Commission to approve $39,901.36 and to
deny $558,004.30. There were 40 claims submitted, the breakdown is as follows:

18 - 45.00%
8 - 20.00%
4 - 10.00%
3 - 7.50%
2 - 5.00%
4

1

t

UNM Health Sciences Center
Living Cross Ambulance
Presbyterian Hospital
Lovelace Medical Center
Presbyterian Medical Group

- 10.00% - Radiology Associates
- 2.50% - UNM Medical Group

The payment for approved claims is as follows;

$23,062.39
1,696.00
6,000.00
9,000.00
51.86
32.58 -
58.53 -

1

UNM Health Sciences Center
Living Cross Ambulance
Presbyterian Hospital
Lovelace Medical Center
Presbyterian Medical Group
Radiology Associates

UNM Medical Group

There are {0 applicant denials which are;

11075, 11088, 11090 and 11096- Income
11076, 11091, 11092 and 11093 - No Response
11102 and 11103 - 90 Day Limit

B: 074 P: 445
B T o Ll KL ¥ B

Exhibit B



The unpaid bafance of the medical bills for the approved claims is $439,464.31 and the unpaid
balance of the ambulance bills for the approved claims is $3,223.58.

Thank you for your consideration.

Sincerely,

N@\JL/LLG_/L L@ML

Barbara A. Baker

B: 074 P: 446
B P Y a0 P el B 1



VALENCIA COUNTY COMMISSION MEETING

Charles D. Eaton, Chair

Mary J. Andersen

Donald E. Holliday

Alicia Aguilar, Co-Chair

LLawrence R. Romero

P.O. Box 1119 *** Los Lunas, New Mexico 87031

Page 1 of 3

Provider Indigent
Provider Account Number Amount Billed Amount Denied  Amount Paid
UNM Health Sciences Cenier 215457052 11075 6,598.70 6,5698.70 0.00
UNM Health Sciences Center 215104753 11076 28,031.95 28,031.95 0.00
Presbyterian Hospital 001335403-2250 11077 3,836.00 936.00 3,000.00
UNM Health Sciences Center 217157557 11078 1,279.40 294,27 985.13
Lovelace Medical Center P1230400022 11079 30,147.25 27,147.25 3,000.00
UNM Health Sciences Center 216829937 11080 2,632.75 605.54 2,027.21
Living Cross Ambulance 78452 11081 103.38 7.38 88.00
Living Cross Ambulance 78974 10182 1,149.29 749.29 400.00
UNM Health Sciences Center 218255230 11082 11,345,30 8,345.30 3,000.00
Living Cross Ambulance 76812 11083 1,281.10 881.10 400.00
UNM Health Sciences Center 218107233 11083 4,450.00 1,450.00 3.000.00
UNM Health Sciences Center 215422924 11084 28,336,35 25,336.35 3,000.00
UNM Health Sciences Center 216493288 11085 243,572.37 241,572.37 2,000.00
Living Cross Ambulance 76612 11086 1,154.14 754,14 400.00
UNM Health Sciences Center 217947225 11086 35,776.10 32,776.10 3.000.00
UNM Health Sciences Center 216545665 11087 7,470.30 4,470.30 3,000.00
UNM Heaith Sciences Center 218090801 11088 6,136.20 §,136.20 0.00
UNM Health Sciences Center 215964057 11089 34,209.10 31,709.10 2,500.00

TOTALS 447,609.68 417,801.34 29,808.34

B: 074 P: 447

IR A R 1



VALENCIA COUNTY COMMISSION MEETING

Charles D. Eaton, Chair

Alicia Aguilar, Co-Chair

Mary J. Andersen

Donald E. Holliday

Lawrence R. Romero

P.O. Box 1119 *** Los Lunas, New Mexico 87031

Page 2 of 3

Provider Indigent

Provider Account Number Amount Billed Amount Denied Amount Paid
UNM Health Sciences Center 217765088 11089 2,107.65 1,607.65 500.00
Presbyterian Hospital 001392844-2265 11080 6,196.32 5,196.32 0.00
Presbyterian Hospital 001382844-2269 11090 340.60 340.60 0.00
Living Cross Ambulance 75072 11091 1,135.56 1,135.56 0.00
Living Cross Ambulance 76821 11091 1,149.29 1,149.29 0.00
UNM Health Sciences Center 216814922 11092 465.00 465.00 0.00
UNM Health Sciences Center 217135417 11083 7,416.65 7,416.85 0.00
Living Cross Ambulance 76726 11094 1,231.67 831.87 400.00
Lovelace Medica! Center P1232300301 11094 4,076.00 1,076.00 3,000.00
Presbyterian Hospitai 001140375-2316 11085 31,038.10 28,038.10 3,000.00
Living Cross Ambulance 75075 11096 1,355.24 1,355.24 0.00
UNM Health Sciences Center 216249656 11096 37,046.10 37.048.10 0.00
UNM Hesaith Sciences Center 217222066 11096 19,386.80 19,386.80 0.00
Lovelace Medicai Center P1233900008 11087 36,823.00 33,823.00 3,000.00
Presbyterian Medical Group BL10078549020 11088 107.00 81.07 256.93
Radiology Associates 15400138 11099 26.00 9.71 16.29
Radiology Associates 15400134 11100 26.00 9.71 16.29
Presbyterian Medical Group 862814 11101 107.00 81.07 25.93

TOTALS 150,033.98 140,049.54 9,984 .44

B: 074 P: 448

I o o R i MBS il B R




Page 3 of 3
VALENCIA COUNTY COMMISSION MEETING
Charies D. Eaton, Chair Alicia Aguilar, Co-Chair
Mary J. Andersen Donald E. Holliday Lawrence R. Romero
P.0. Box 1119 * * * Los Lunas, New Mexico 87031
Provider indigent
Provider Account Number Amount Billed Amount Denied Amount Paid
Radiology Associates 15257157 11102 28.00 28.00 0.00
Radiology Assaciates 15237045 11103 30.00 30.00 0.00
UNM Health Sciences Center 212841076 11104 85.00 14.95 50.05
UNM Medical Group 5010773 11104 138.00 80,47 58.53
Subtotal 252.00 153.42 108.58
Valencia County Commissioners Total A 597,905.66 558,004.30 39,801.36
Charles D. Eaton, Chair\ ; _
Alicia Aguilar, Co-Chair ij%% -
Mary J. Andersen C‘ %% §2 = =c:.):-_:gs_.__,m
Donald E. Holliday
Lawrence R. Romero

B: 074 P: 449
B T Yt L T



« 000 0L '9v0'2E «  ZLIS0/0L-82/60 18juaQ saduatog yieaH IWNN *

SLI02U[ 000 V2 GSE'L ajons 21/82/60 doUenquly ssoid BUAT W 8b/52/20 96011

00°000'c  0L°8E0°LE BlUloWnaud  ZL/yL/LL-LL/LL [EjdsoH ueusiigsald W £2/50/0  SB0LL
00000t 00°9/0'% . zLgLLL 183US9 [BOIPaIN SOB[BAOT .

0000y  /91ET'L linessy cHBLLL BoUBINQY SSOIJ BuINT 4 Z6/bE/L0  YBOLL

Ssuodsay ON 000 59'9L¥'/. umo LN ghHazioL 1BJU8] SB0ULDS YiBSH NN 4 09/8L/SD  £60LL

osuodsay oN 000 00°59% Ainfu) puey ZhHiL1IB0 18jua) S30UBIOS LRI IWNN 4 66/62/80 Z60LL

— » 00°0 BCEYL'L suoIs|nALo) cLiLe aouBINqUY ssosg buia *
= asuodsay ON 00'0 95'seL"| Buipesig Aynoyiag zl/8e/60 9oUBINgWY SS0I) Buain 1 Jorgzivo  LeDLL
—== « 000 09°0¥¢ . ZLIve/B0 feydsoy ueusifgsalg .
= SWoaU| 000 2e96L'9 Buipesig jeuiBen  zl/1z/60 leldsoH uewaigsald 4 59/92/LL  060L)
S 0000 59201z x ZLEMLL 12)us] s80UB0S YHESH NN .
%M 00005z O} 60Z'PE a.njie4 Heay aAisabuo)  z1/52/60-02/60 18jUa) s2ouBds WieaH NN 4 £9/01/L0 68011
Bec 300U 000 0Z'9€L'9 BSBISIQ 1A ZL/ET/LL-LE/L L 18jual) s82ULOS UNESH WINN W 25/82/L0  880LL

.o om== 00000'€  QE0L¥'.2 fiabing joeieR) ZLiBLLL 1997 S30USOg YeeH WNN N €9/21/S0 28011
ol = 00'000't  01'9//'GE « CHLZILLLLILY J2lua) seouLiag YijeaH NN .
=8 0000F  ¥L'PGL') BlUotLNaud cLaLLL BouE|nquly ssou) BuiA W Z5/20/0 9801 L
<3 W 00000'C ZETiS'the usLiopqy w aimdny - Z1/90/21-80/0} 8]0 s80UBdG YifesH NN 4 2S/EL/60  §80L L
P 00°000'€  5E'9£E'8z Bluownauy - gl/1 L/60-10/60 8jue) sadUBdg UIBSH WNN N 61/0L/ZL #8011
@ﬂ. 00 000'E 00 0S¥ . ZLETILL 13)U8) $30UBIOS ylleaH NN .
= 0000  0L'18Z'L pajule gHEzILL aoue|nquiy ssoi) BuAn 4 SprLobD €801 L

o 00°000'C  0EGPELL « CHBZ/LL-8TILL 18jURY $20UBIS YieaH NN .
2 = 0000F  BT6PLL uied 3sa4o ZLI8T/LL Soueinquiy ssoid Buin W p9/8LP0  ZROLL
= 00 96 8E €01 ynessy CLpLiLL 90UV SSOID BN 4 94/92//0  L8OLL

== \C'/20'c §/72£9'C sainzeg  ZL//L/0L-91L/0) 18jua] saouBlog WiesH NN I €4/10/LL  080LL

. 00000t Sz /¥l'oE fsbing Jappeg e ZH0E0L 13JUB]) [EJIP3IN B0B[RAOT 4 26/E0/LL  6/0LL
€1'586  OF'6.T'L Uied {euilopgy zLigTioL 8jus]) sa0UBI0g WESH INNN 4 Z2/ZLiZL 8/0LL

00000’ 0D0'9E6'E sainzieg  z1/20/60-90/60 feydsol uewagsaid 4 26/20/80 L/0L)

asuodsay ON 000 56°L£0'8¢ SaINZIBS  ZL/LE/80-52/80 J8jUaD SAUBG ilesH IWINN N 98//L/LL 9201

BLI0AU] 000 0/ '€65'9 MOQ|3 paledolsiq  Z1/90/60-G0/60 1SJUS] SA0UIOS YResH WNN 4 95/SL/0L  G20LL

jejuagq  pied pajig sisoubeiq SRR SlIeN 18plaold Xag  9jeg  "ON Q!

Jo} uUoseay 40 (s)ajeq

€102 ‘91 AYVYNNYT

D07 SNIVTIO ANNH LNIDIANI ALNNOD YIONITVA

Unig



L

9£°1L06'6¢E

€5 85

50 05
nwi Aeq 06 000
Hwry Ae@ 06 000

€6 G2

6291

62 91

£6'GZ

00'000'E

« 000

99'506°265
00'BEL
00'G9

00 0¢
00'82
00201
0092
0092
00201

00 £28'9¢
08'98E'6}

Anfu) Ba - pyr

Aeg-X - v

199[90 pamojems - TP
Anfuy woy - v

Amiu) puey - Jpyr

Anfuj puey - v

Aanfuy puey - vr

1sAQ [eULIOPQY  21/90/2L-VO/Z)
ZLILO/LL-82/0L

x

chiS0/LL
[ASAYEY
¢H/50/30
cH50/20
cH0E/LL
chiLLiol
cH8L0L
cHiLei )

LAY R

dnols) [ea1paly WNN

Isjua) ssouatog ileaH NN
Sajeossy ABojoipey
s3]e100ssYy ABojoipey

dnolg) |eaipapy velsiigsalg
sa)e|o0ssy ABojoipey
s8]elnossy ABojoipey

dnois) [eaipay uenshgsaig
tejue)) jeoipa|y BoEaACT]
JBIUBD S$20UBI9S UHeSH WNN

LEZ=Z=2=Z2Z=2=

m
=
=8

451
e

074 P:
RLBLLKf

B:

Bl KA e

8B/Cé/C)
L9/61/60
CeIET/L0
c8ree/Lo
L4ee/L0
¢6/0€/10
18/LZ/L L
va/80/L L

FoLLL
oLl
0L
LOLLL
goLLL
66011
86011
16011



Valencia County Indigent & Insurance

BARBARA A. BAKER, ADMINISTRATOR

Fost Office Box 1119 - Los Lunas, New Mexico 87031
Phone ' (505) 866-2020 - Fax: (505) 866-33G6

Date: lanuary 16, 2013

To:  Valencia County Board of County Commissioners
From: Barbara A. Baker CHD

Subj:  Thomas Byrns - Indigent Appeal

Thomas Byrns has requested an Indigent Appeal for the Indigent Denial of November 26,
2012 for his Presbyterian Hospital bill. Mr. Byrns was denied as he does have insurance,
but the insurance has a high deductible. [ would like to recommend approval of the
balance of the Presbyterian Hospital bill in the amount of $3,229.26 as Mr. Byms
qualifies with all of the other requirements. If approved the amount being paid to
Presbyterian Hospital would be $2,486.53.

Approved by the Board of County Compmissioners at the regular meeting of January 16,
2013, _~ )

arles D, Eﬁton Chair

=
. m%J)\
L/

Alicia Aguilar, Co-Chair

4 : P. 452
%/VLLLAD MM mi H.*faﬁﬁks-.lﬁ&%ﬂﬁah SR P B

g 1/,,. Exhibit C

Lawrmlce,‘R Romero

gﬁ o
ATTEST Y’
p e LGPﬂgg@CarabaJMf{ncza County Clerk




Valencia County Indigent & Insurance

BARBARA A. BAKER, ADMINISTRATOR

FPost Office Box 1119 - Los Lunas, New Mexico 87031
Phone - (505} 866-2020 - Fax; (505) 866-3366

Date: January 16,2013

To:  Valencia County Board of County Commissioners
From: Barbara A. Baker LM-&

Subj:  Ivan Garcia - Indigent Inmate Appeal

Bruce Swingie has requested an Indigent Appeal for the Indzgeul’: Denial of December 19,
2012 of Ivan Garcia for his ABQ Health Partners bill in the amount of $382.00. Mr.
Garcia was denied as the bill was received after the 90 day limit. T would like to
recommend approval of the ABQ Health Partners bill in the amount of $382.00. If
approved the amount being paid to ABQ Health Partners wouid be $87.23.

Approved by the Board of County COH‘H‘HISSIODEIS at the regular meeting of January 16,

201/
(A 4]

Charlef’f) Eatoﬁ Chair

™
<7

W\L‘\HM -ui?ué'\,v <
Alicia Aguilar, Co~ChaE\/

%@J A

DonaIdE Hoihéf'ly Chair ™

ER Y - hibit D
Lawrence R. Romerq\' -~ . Ex

ATTESTED BY:

B: @?4 P. 453
B P sl A0 DR S, B



Valencia County Indigent & Insurance

BARBARA A. BAKER, ADMINISTRATOR

Post Office Box 1119 - Los Lunas, New Mexico §7031
Phone - (505) 866-2020 - Fax: (505} 866-3366

Date: January 16, 2013

To:  Valencia County Board of County Commissioners

From: Barbara A. Baker “$ob

Subj:  Jeanette Laurel - Indigent Appeal

Jeanette Laurel has requested an Indigent Appeal for the Indigent Denial of December 19,
2012 for her Lovelace Medical Center bill. Ms. Laurel was denied as she does have
Medicare, but there is a deductible. I would like to recommend approval of the balance

of the Lovelace Medical Center bill in the amount of $1,156.00 as Ms. Laurel qualifies

with all of the other requirements. 1f approved the amount being paid to Lovelace
Medical Center would be $890.12,

Approved by the Board of County Commissioners at the regular meeting of January 16,

g

arles D. Eaton, Cha—"

;\J\L\:\ g QCXVJ\‘\

Alicia Aguilar, CO-CIi%)
Mary I. fﬁde/aén"

Donald E. Holliday, Chair {

........

Exhibit
Lawrence R. Romersg & ™ . E
; :} :-

ATTESTED BY: . ,r*

ngfg,}i;c

3

B: 074 P: 454
BRI B bl U P M,

T~
g




January 23, 2013

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN:

SUBIJECT:

FROM:

Sincerely,

TRANSFERANCE OF LIQUOR LICENSE TO SITE NEAR OR ON
LAS VEGAS AND HWY 47 LOS LUNAS, NM

OPEN DOOR CHURCH OF GOD
3419 HWY 47 (P.O. 2695)
LOS LUNAS, NM §7031

Let it be known to the said deciding officials of the above transfer of
liquor license to said location of approximately Las Vegas and Hwy 47
Los Lunas, NM, that we oppose this and any action.

We have not been duly notify of the meeting to carryout this transfer.
We are opposed to any sale of liquor within the said area which have five
churches and one elementary school within one half mile of the said

location.

And as a resident of Los Lunas at 29 Bloom n Shine and of Valencia
County. I oppose this action.

Pasfor Jim Moiitoya

//Open Door €hurch of God

P.O. Box2695
Los Lunas, NM 87031

Exhibit F

_ B: 074 P: 455
B o L A ), B




Exhibit G

HEDOS A Eh,
3 ounty

Ne= /

VALENCIA COUNTY
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
RESOLUTION NO. 2013- O

PUBLIC NOTICE DESCRIBING PROCEDURES FOR REQUEST INSPECTION

By law, under the Inspection of Public Records Act, every person has the right to inspect
public records of the Board of County Commissioners of the County of Valencia. The Act
also makes compliance with requests to inspect public records an integral part of the routine
duties of the officers and employees of the Board of County Commissioners of the County of
Valencia.

Procedures for Requesting Inspection. Requests to inspect public records should be submitted
to the records custodian, Bruce Swingle, located at 444 Luna Avenue, Los Lunas, NM
87031, (505) 866-2014, (505) 866-3355 (facsimile), Bruce.Swingle@co.valencia.nm.us.

A person desiring to inspect public records may submit a request to the records custodian
orally or in writing. However, the procedures and penalties prescribed by the Act apply only
to written requests. A written request must contain the name, address and telephone number
of the person making the request. Written requests may be submitted in person or sent via US
mail, email or facsimile. The request must describe the records sought in sufficient detail to
enable the records custodian to identify and locate the requested records.

The records custodian must permit inspection immediately or as soon as practicable, but no
later than 15 calendar days after the records custodian receives the inspection request. If
inspection is not permitted within three business days, the person making the request will
receive a written response explaining when the records will be available for inspection or
when the public body will respond to the request. If any of the records sought are not
available for public inspection, the person making the request is entitied to a written response
from the records custodian explaining the reasons inspection has been denied. The written
denial shall be delivered or mailed within 15 calendar days after the records custodian
received the request for inspection.

Procedures for Requesting Copies and Fees. If a person requesting inspection would like a
copy of a public record, a reasonable fee may be charged, as detailed in the chart below.

Item One Side Page Two Side Page
Photo Copies $0.35 $0.60
Reader/Printer Copies $0.50 $0.50
Newspaper $1.00 $1.50
Ordinances & Resolutions | $0.50 (per page) $0.50

B: 074 P. 456
B0 U T A T L 11




18” x 24 Plats $4.00 N/A
24 x 367 Plats $6.00 N/A
36" Plus Plats $1.00 for each additional
foot
Electronic Data $5.00 per CD plus $0.01 per | N/A
document
Documents Scanned to | $0.25 N/A
Electronic Format
Notary Public $3.00 NA

The records custodian may request that applicable fees for copying public records be paid in
advance, before the copies are made. A receipt indicating that the fees have been paid for
making copies of public records will be provided upon request to the person requesting the

copies. 0?3 s
APPROVED, ADOPTED, AND PASSED on this ,I'Grrr:iay of January, 2013.

/% BOARD ef?mf COMMISSIONERS

Y

(L‘* ‘i_)s.&g 2 L/Q

Chrles D. Eaton

Chairman, DIStI‘lCt IV
7 -7

{ / e
MﬁlyJ A(ndersen
Commiss;oner District I

 Dematd W

/ -

Ahcm Aguilar
Vice-Chair, District 11

Lawrence R. Romero
Commissioner. District II1

Donald E. HoIhday
Cornmissioner, District V

Q&%St’ """"
r,:"’l."

5""\_ : ﬁ . ‘5 .

I Pt }kgéralwﬁﬁ—é‘ﬁmty Clerk
LD v >l
A A
.‘ff'.’s‘_ = “_‘x

gy

B: 074
B BT AT T et

. 457
AR TN e LT L



Moo -~ D L B W) R —

1y

Exhibit H

VALENCIA COUNTY
BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
ORDINANCE NO. 2013- O |
AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING THE 2006 EBITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL
FIRE CODE, REGULATING AND GOVERNING THE SAFE-GUARDING OF
LIFE AND PROPERTY FROM FIRE AND EXPLOSION HAZARDS ARISING
FROM THE STORAGE, HANDLING AND USE OF HAZARDOUS
SUBSTANCES, MATERIALS, AND DEVICES, AND FROM CONDITIONS
HAZARDOUS TO LIFE OR PROPERTY IN THE OCCUPANCY OF
BUILDINGS AND PREMISES IN THE COUNTY OF VALENCIA; PROVIDING
FOR THE ISSUANCE OF PERMITS AND COLLECTION OF FEES
THEREFOR; REPEALING ORDINANCE NO’S §9-04 AND 90-1 OF THE
COUNTY OF VALENCIA.
Section 1. Short Title: International Fire Code
Seetion 2. Purpose.
The purpose is to adopt the 2006 edition of the International Fire Code regulating and
governing the safe-guarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards arising
from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances materials and devices, and
from conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings in the County
of Valencia; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefore.
Section 2.1. Scope.
This code establishes regulations affecting or relating to structures, processes, premises,
and safeguards regarding:

1. Hazards of fire and explosions arising from the storages, handling or use of

structures, materials or devices:

B: 074 P: 458
BRI T el L L T Ui




2

(5]

[Sw]

Conditions hazardous to life, property, or public welfare in the occupancy of

structures;

[¥S

Fire hazards in the structure on the premises from occupancy or operation;
4. Matters related to the construction, extension, repair, alteration or removal of
fire suppression or alarm systems.
Section 3. Definitions.
A. Valencia County adopts the definitions as defined in the 2006 edition of the
International Fire Code hereinafter “Fire code,” with the following exceptions:

) “County Fire Chief” is the single and sole administrative and command
authority for the Valencia County Emergency Services.

2) “Chief Engineer,” “Chief” or “Chief of the Fire Department” where used
in the Fire Code shall mean “County Fire Chief” as defined in Section 3(A) above or the Chief’s
authorized representative.

3 “Fire Code Official” were used in the Fire Code shall mean the Valencia
County Fire Marshal, or his/her dully authorized representative, who has the authority to
interpret and enforce the Fire Code and this Ordinance.

4) *Executive Body™ is the Valencia County Board of County

Commissioners.
5} “Fire Department” is the Valencia County Emergency Services.
o) “Firework and “Special Firework™ shall have the same meaning as defined

in the New Mexico Fireworks Licensing and Safety Act, 60-2C-1 et. Seq. N.M.S.A. (1978).
7 “Fire Code” is the fire code and standards adopted by Valencia County

Ordinance as amended,

B: 074 P: 459
LT N T N TP

Revised on 09/11/2012



[

]
(%)

8) “Building code” is the building code and standards adopted by Valencia
County Ordinance as amended.

9) “Electrical Code” is the electrical code and standards adopted by Valencia
County Ordinance as amended.

10y “Jurisdiction” is Valencia County, which has adopted the International
Fire Code for use i its jurisdictional area.

11y “Jurisdictional Area” is the unincorporated portions of Valencia County or
other areas as designated by joint powers agreement, memorandum of understanding, and mutuaf
aid.

B. All the definitions contained in NMSA 60-2C-2 of the New Mexico Fireworks
Licensing and Safety Act, 60-2C-1, et seq. N.M.S.A. 1978 is adopted for the purposes of this
ordinance and the International Fire Code.

Section 4. Adoption of the International Fire Code

The 2006 edition of the International Fire Code, including appendices B, C and D
published by the International Fire Code Institute, being particularly the 2006 Edition is hereby
adopted, saves and except such portions as are deleted, modified or amended by this ordinance.

All Fire Codes, Standards and Supplements, as published by the National Fire Protection
Association (NFPA)

All current Codes and Standards of the International Plumbing, Mechanical and Electrical
Codes as published by the International Code Counci! (ICC).

For the purpose of prescribing minimum regulations governing conditions hazardous to
life and property from fire, hazardous materials, or explosion within the County of Valencia,

New Mexico, the following is adopted.

B: 074 P: 460
Revisedonooriizorz I WFURAERMIY b AT MYl B



I~

Lk

17

18

19

3
2

s
Ly

Revised on 09/11/2012

The following documents are hereby adopted as the Valencia County Fire Code, and

from the date on which this ordinance takes effect shall be controlling within the boundaries of

the County of Valencia, New Mexico:

Section 5. Duties for Fire Prevention.
This ordinance, The Fire Code shall be enforced by the Valencia County Emergency
Services, which 1s established pursuant to Valencia County Ordinance.

Section 6. Amendments to the Fire Code.

The Fire Code is amended and changed in the following respects:

International Fire Code, Chapter 1 Section 102.3 entitled “ Administration:

Applicability; Change of use or occupancy” is hereby amended to read the

following:

No changes shall be made in the use or occupancy of any structure that would place the
structure in a different division of the same group or occupancy or in a different group of
occupancies, unfess such structure is made to comply with the requirements of this code,
the International Building Code, and section 903.6 of the Fire Code, for existing
buildings. Subject to approval of the fire code official, the use of occupancy of an
existing structure shall be permitted to be changed and the structure is allowed to be
occupied for the purposes in other groups without conforming to all the requirements of
this code and the International Building code for those groups provided the specific
requirements of the fire Code, Section 903.6, are applied and the new or proposed use is

less hazardous, based on life and fire risk, than the existing use.

B: 074 P: 461
B Ao P LR S e, 1



[£8]

el

-
0 BT e }

5

O 00~ o oy b W

L B e O

| e I o (NG R (NG I O R (e
Fa

I
wn

[TE T (S N N |
(N« - S

(W8]
o

Ly L L L W
£ B e

Ln

International Fire Code, Chapter 1 Section 102.4 entitled “Administration:

Applicability; Application of building code” is hereby amended to read as follows:

102.4 Application of building code. The design and construction of new structures shall
comply with the International Building Code. Repairs, alterations, additions, changes in
use or changes in structures required by this code which are within the scope of the
International building Code, shall be made in accordance therewith.

International Fire Code, Chapter 1 Section 102.5 entitled Administration;

Applicability; Historic Buildings” is hereby amended to read as follows:

102.5 Historic Building. The provisions of this relating to the construction, alteration.
repair, enlargement, restoration, relocation or moving of buildings or structures shall not
be mandatory for existing buildings or structures identified and classified by the state or
local jurisdiction as historic buildings when such buildings or structures do not constitute
a district hazard to life or property. Fire protection in designated historic building and
structures shall be provided in accordance with an approved fire protection plan

developed in accordance with the provisions of NFPA 909.

International Fire Code, Chapter 1 Section 102.6 entitled Administration;:

Applicability; Referenced codes and standards” is hereby amended to read as follows:

102.6 Referenced Codes and Standards. The codes and standards referenced in this code
Shall be the most currently published edition of those that are listed in Chapter 45 and
Such codes and standards shall be considered part of the requirements of this code to the

Prescribed extent of each such reference. Where differences occur between the provisions

| B: 074 P. 462
fevsedon RO B R L AT RSB,



[

ud

o

A=}

Of this code and the referenced standards, the provisions of this code shall apply.

International Fire Code, Chapter I Section 102.9 entitled Administration;

Applicability; Conflicting Provision” is hereby amended to read as_follows:

102.9 Conflicting provisions. Where there is conflict between a general requirement and
a specific requirement, the specific requirement shall be applicable. Where there is a conflict
between this Code, and another Code, rule, or regulation of the County, the more stringent
shall apply.

Iuternatioual Fire Code, Chapter 1 Section 104.3 entitled Administration; General

Authority and Respousibilities: Right to Entry” is hereby amended to add the following

at the end of the section:

104.3 Right of Entry. In the event entry is denied to a building or premise which is
commercial in nature and the International Fire Code requires such to have a permit, the
Chief may order the permit revoked; provided, however, that the request to enter must
have been during reasonable hours and, upon denial of entry, a warning of the possibie

revocation must have been given,

International Firc Code, chapter 1 section 104.5 is amended to add the following at

the end of the section:

1.) The permit-tee has caused a release of hazardous materials into the environment.

B: 074 P: 463
B W R LA ERNN B B

Revised on 09/11/2012



b2

10

11

17

18

19

Revised on 09/11/2012 B 074 P: 464

Infernartional Fire Code, Chiaprer I Section 104.10 entitled Administration: General

Authority and Responsibilities: Fire Investigations” is hrereby amended to read as

foliows:

104.10 Fire Investigation. The Chief is authorized to make investigations deemed
necessary of any fire or explosion in Valencia County, and to require reports from his/her
officers concerning all fires and explosions 1n the jurisdictional area. For the purpose of
such investigation, the Chief is authorized to conduct hearings, subpoena witnesses, take
testimony, and enter and examine any building, premises or vehicle where any fire or
explosion or attempt to cause a fire or explosion has occurred or which at the time may
be burning. The Chief has the power to cause to be produced before him/her such
evidence as he/she may require in making such examination. In addition, the Chief may,
i the exercise of his/her discretion, take temporary control and custody of building,
premises. Vehicles, items, devices, and things placing such persons in charge thereof as
he/she deems proper, until examination, investigation, prosecution, and /or [awful

destruction is completed.

ITuternational Fire Code, Chapter 1 Section 105.4 entitled “Administration; Permits:

Coustruction Documents” is hereby amended by adding a new subsection 105.1.1

entitled “Plan review fee” thereto, read as follows:

105.4.1.1 Plan review fee. Plan review and inspections fees are required for fire

protection systems as determined by the County. The fee entitles the submitter to an

B R, ) R T A e, B



15

a

¥

18

19

It
[N

I
L2

Revised on 09/11/2012

inttial plan review and one re-submittal to correct errors or omission. A fee equal to the
submittal fee shall be charged for each re-submittal beginning with the second re-
submittal if the same corrections must again be noted. This fee shall not be refunded once

a plan check has begun. The required inspections shall be included in the fee.

Infernational Fire Code, Chapter 1 Section 105.6.30 entitled “Administration; Permits;

Open Burning” is hereby amended by deleting the exception.

International Fire Code, Cliapter I Section 105.7 entitled “Administration; Permits;

Required Construction Permits” is hereby amended to read as follows:

105.7 Required Construction Permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue

construction permits for work as set forth in Sections 105.7.1 through 105.7.14,

International Fire Code, Chapter 1 Section 105.7 entitled “Administration: Pernrifs;

Required construction permits” is hereby amended by adding a new subsection

105.7.14 thereto entitled “Fire apparatus and persounel access” to read as follows:

105.7.14 Fire apparatus and personnel access. A construction permit is required for the
following:

1. To install or modify any access control device across a fire apparatus road.

2. To modify or encroach on any fire apparatus access road.

3. To modify any personnel access point into buildings or facilities.

B: 074 P: 465
B W Y e L A L b B




[0S}

L

15

16

17

SN
[}

as]
[*5)

International Fire Code, chapter 1 section 108.1 entitled “Administration; Board of

Appeals; Board of appeals establislied” is hereby amended to the following:

108.1Board of appeals established. In order to hear and decide appeal of order,
decision or determinations made by the fire code official refative to the application and
interpretation of this code, there shall and hereby is created a Board of Appeals, herein
after “The Board” consisting of five (5} members who are qualified by experience and
training to pass upon pertinent matters. The Board of County Commissioners with
overlapping terms shall appoint the Board. The board shall adopt reasonable rules and
regulations for conducting its business and investigations and shall render all decisions
and findings in writing to the Chief, with a duplicate copy to the Appellant and County

Clerk, and may recommend to the executive body such new legislation as in consistent

therewith.

a) Any party aggrieved by an order or decision of any official of the Fire Department
under the International Fire Code may appeal said order or decision to the Board,
provided such party has first applied to the Chief in writing for reconsideration of
the i1ssue and the Chief has denied all or part of such party’s request. Appeals shail
be allowed from an adverse decision of the Chief.

b) Written notice of such an appeal must be given to the Chief within ten (10)
calendar days after the date of the order. Said notice shall contain an enumeration
of the specific order or decision complained of, the date of issuance thereof,

B: 074 466
Revisedonto/12012 [ BRI AL WA, B



18]

[¥3)

c)

d)

€)

Revised on 09/11/2012 1) PV Ak T o e [ P et B

person issuing such order or decision, and a brief statement of the reasons why
such an order or decision is impractical, unwarranted, or creates an unnecessary
hardship. Said ten {10) day period is jurisdictional and shall not be waived.
Hearing on appeals shall be held within fifteen {15} calendar days after notice of
appeal 1s received. unless otherwise agreed by both parties. Stay of the appealed
order or time limits may be granted by the Board pending decision from the
Board, unless the violation constitutes an immediate hazardous to life or to
property.

For the purposes of hearing appeals, the Board shall have the power to issue
subpoenas, serve warrants, processes, make inspections, and require submission
of plans and specifications or, submission of such other evidence as is deemed
necessary.

Reasonable written notice of the time, place, and nature of the hearing shall be
given to all parties. In conducting a hearing, the Board shall give all parties an
opportunity for a full and fair hearing, including the right to counsel and the right
to call and examine witnesses to testify. The hearing shall be conducted in an
orderly manner, and the Chairperson shall exclude all irrelevant, immaterial and
unduly repetitious evidence.

On hearing of an appeal, the Board shall have the power to reverse, affirm, or
amend the orders’ time limit or decision of the Chief, or to grant an alternative
method from the provisions of the International Fire Code and this ordinance;
provided that before reversing or amending such order or decision, or authorizing

such variance, the Board shall first find that in each instance, strict enforcement of

B: 074 P: 467

il



~J

(%)

[
L2

the order’s time limit or decision is impractical, unwarranted, or creates an
unnecessary hardship. Such reversals, or amendments, or variances must be in
conformance with the sprit and intent of the International Fire Code and must
reasonable secure the public safety.

) In every appeal, the Board shall issue its written decision within seven (7)
calendar days after such hearing. Each decision shall include the Board’s findings
and conclusions, shall be signed by each member of the Board. The decision may
reverse, affirm, amend, or grant variance as to each order or decision listed by the
aggrieved party in their notice of appeal under Sub-Section (C) of 108.1. Every
decision or opinion of the Board shall be made part of the official records of the
Valencia County Fire Department. A copy of the board’s decision or opinion shall

be given to the aggrieved party and shall be filed in the office of the County

Clerk.
h) The decision of the Board shall be final and exhausts all administrative remedies.
1) The Board shall maintain, for at least one (1) year, a list of appeals heard before it

and the order or decisions rendered by the Board.

Interuational Fire Code, Chapter 1 Section 109.3 entitled “Administration; Violations:

Violation penalties” is lrereby amended to the following:

Section 109.3 Violation penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this
code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall
erect, install, alter, repair, or do work in violation of the approved construction

documents or directives of the fire code official, or of a permit used under the

- B: 074 P: 468
Revised on 09/1112012 BT PR e A TR P o) RS e B




18]

L)

provision of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable by a fine of
up to $300.00, or by imprisonment not exceeding 90 days, or both such fine and
imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been

served shall be deemed a separate offence.

International Fire Code, Clapter 1 Section 109.3 entitled “Administration; Violations;

15 liereby amended by adding a new subsection 109.3.2 entitled “ Abatement of

Envirommental, Health, Fire or Life Safety Hazards by Fire Marslial” to read as

follows.

17

18

19

109.3.2 dbatement of Environmental, Health, Fire or Life Safety Hazards by fire
Code Official. If any person fails to comply with the order of the Fire Code
Official, or if the Fire Code Official is unable to locate the owner. operator,
occupant, or other person responsible within a reasonable amount of time, the Fire
Code Official or any authorized representative may take such steps as are
necessary to abate the hazard for the protection and safety of the public. Notice is
not necessary before abatement, when the hazard is a clear and present danger to
the public welfare. All costs and attorneys fees related to such abatement shall

become a lien on the subject property.

Interuational Fire Code, Chapter 1 Section 111.4 entitled “Administration; Stop work

Order; Failure to comply” is liereby amended to read as follows:

111.4 Failure to Comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having

been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to

B: 074 P: 469

Revised on 09/11/2012 B WA o T L L LN .



b

[¥%]

Lh

17

18

19

I
N

28]
L

perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be guilty of a
misdemeanor, punishable by a fine of up to $300.00 or by imprisonment not

exceeding 90 days or both such fine and imprisonment.

International Fire Code, Chapter 2 entitled “Definitions:” is amended to add the

following:

All the definitions contained in Section 60-2C-2 of the New Mexico Fireworks Licensing
and Safety Act, 60-2C-1 et seq.. NMSA 1978 are adopted for the purposes of this

article and the Fire Code.

International Fire Code, Chapter 2 Section 202 entitled “Definitions; General

Definitions; Occupancy Classification; [B] Institutional group I; Group I-1” is hereby

amended to read as follows:

Group I-1. This occupancy shall inciude buildings, structures or parts thereof housing
more than 10 persons, on 24- hour basis, who because of age, mental disability or other
reason, live in a residential environment that provide supervisory care service. The
occupants are capable of responding to an emergency situation without physical
assistance from staff. This group shall include, but not limited to, the following:
residential board and care facilities, assisted living centers, half-way houses, group
homes, congregate care facilities, alcohol and drug abuse centers, social rehabilitation

facilities, and convalescent facilities.

B: 074 P: 470
B DR s LR 1

Revised on 09/11/2012



[

L

wn

15

6

17

12
12

2
[PX]

A facility such as the above with 10 or fewer persons shall be classified as a Group R-4

Condition 1.

Iuternational Fire Code, Cliapter 2 Section 202 entitled “Definitions; General

Definitions; Occupancy Classification; [B] Residential Group R; R-4” is liereby

amended to read as follows:

R-4 Residential occupancies shall inciude building arranged for occupancy as residential
carc/assisted living homes including not more than 10 occupants, excluding staff.

R-4 Condition 1. This occupancy shall include facilities licensed to provide supervisory
care services, in which occupants are capable of self-preservation by responding to an
emergency situation without physical assistance from staff. Condition 1 facilities housing
more than 10 persons shall be classified as a Group i-1.

R-4 Condition 2 This occupancy condition shall include facilities licensed to provide
personal or directed care services, in which occupants are incapable of self-preservation
by responding to an emergency without physical assistance from staff. Condition 2

facilities housing more than 5 persons shall be classified as Group 1-2.

International Fire Code, Chapter 2 Section 202 entitled “Definitions; General

Definitions: Occupancy Classification:” is hereby amended by adding the following

tliree definitions:

Directed Care Service. Care, including personal care services, of residence that are
incapable of recognizing danger, summoning assistance, expressing need, or making

B: 074 P
Revised on 091 L2012 W BV 0 0 A R B



N

[F%

w

17

18

19

basic care decisions.

Personal care services. Assistance with activities of daily living that can be performed by
persons without professional skills or professional training and includes the coordination
or provision of intermittent nursing services and the administration of medication and
treatments.

Residential Care/ Assisted Living Home. A building or part thereof housing a maximum
of 10 persons, excluding staff, on a 24-hour basis, who because of age, mental disability
or other reasons, live in a supervised residential environment which provides supervisory,
personal, or directed services. This classification shall inciude, but limited to the
following: Residential board and care facilities, assisted living centers, half-way houses,
group homes, congregate care facilities, social rehabilitation facilities, alcohol and drug

abuse centers, convalescent facilities.

Iuternational Fire Code, Chapter 3 Section 312 eutitled “General Precantions Against

Fire, Vehicle Impact Protection” is hereby amended by adding a new subsection 312.4

thereto entitled “Utility Meters and piping “to read as follows:

312.4 Utility Meter and piping. Utility meters and piping shall be protected from
vehicular impact. Guard posts shall comply with Section 312.2. In addition utility meters

and piping shall be protected from snow shedding or ice buildup from a roof area.

International Fire Code, Cliapter 3 Section 3135.2.3 entitled “General Precautions

Against Fire, Miscellaneous Combustible Material Storage; Equipment Rooms” is

lereby amended to read as follows:

B: 074 P: 472

Revised on 09/11/2012 Ll II'JF-I‘H.’“'F“{': OB AR A e, TR



(3%

L

315.2.3 Equipment Room. Combustible material shall not be stored in boiler rooms,
mechanical rooms, electrical rooms, and other rooms where a potential ignition source

exists, as determined by the fire code official.

International Fire Code, Chapter 4 Section 401.3.1 entitled “ Emergency Planning and

Preparedness: General; Making False Reports” is hereby amended to add the

following at the end of the section:

Any owner of user of a fire alarm system which experiences more than three nuisance
alarms within any calendar year shall be required by the Fire Marshal to modify or improve
said system in such a way to prevent accidental activation and may be subject to penalty by
the Fire Marshal in accordance with the International Fire Code. Prior to modifying any
required system, the owner shall submit an application accompanied by a set of drawings
showing the design and nature of the proposed modifications. The system must be approved

and permitted through the Valencia County Emergency Services Fire Prevention Bureau.

International Fire Code, Chapter 5 Section 503.2.7 entitled “Fire Service Features;

Fire Apparatus Access Roads; Specifications; Grade” is erby amended to read as

follows:

503.2.7 Grade. The grade of the fire apparatus access road shall be within the limits
established by the fire code official based on the fire department’s apparatus. The gradient
for fire apparatus access roads and driveways shall not exceed 12% or the maximum
approved by this code.

Exceptions: The gradient for fire apparatus access roads and driveways may be increased if

B: 074 P: 473
Revisedon 097112012 IR WA Kok LN WO UL o, 11



!

b

(D]
2]

1~
Ll

all structures that the access road or driveway serves are protected by an antomatic sprinkler

system. The gradient of such fire apparatus access roads or driveways shall not exceed 15%.

International Fire Code, Chapter 5 Section 505.1 entitled “Fire Service Features:

Premises Identification; Address ninbers” is lierby amended to read as follows:

503.1 Address Numbers. New and existing buildings shall have approved address numbers,
building numbers or approved building identification placed in a position that is plainly
legible and visible from the street or road fronting the property. These numbers shall contrast
with their background. Address numbers shall be Arabic numerals or alphabet letters.
Numbers shall be a minimum of 6 inches high with minimum stroke width of 0.5 inch. All
street address shall be within 25 feet (762mm)} of the street in an approved location if the

structure or residence is more than 150 feet (45,720 mm) from a fire apparatus access road.

International Fire Code, Chapter 5 Section 505 entitled “Fire Service Features;

Premtises Identification;” is herby amended by adding a nuew subsection 505.3 thereto

entitled “ Change of Address” to read as follows:

303.3 Change of Address. When required by the fire code official, existing address may be
changed to enhance the fire department’s ability to locate the scene in response to an EMS or
Fire call. Any recommendations for changes in street names or numbers shall first be

B: 074 P: 474
Revisedon 91112012 I WAAFR B o Y L P o, 11



13

[VE)

17

18

19

submitted to property owners for comment.

International Fire Code, Chapter 5 Section 506.1 entitled “Fire Service Features: Key

Boxes: Where Required” is rerby amended to read as follows:

306.1 Where required. Where access to or within a structure or an area is restricted because
of secured openings, or where immediate access is necessary for life-safety or fire-fighting
purposes, or where there is an automatic fire sprinkler system or fire alarm system, the fire
code official 1s authorized to require a key box to be installed in an approved accessible
location. The key box shall be an approved type and shall contain keys to gain access as

required by the fire code official.

Iuternational Fire Code, Chapter 5 Section 508.1 entitled “Fire Service Features; Fire

Protection Water Supplies; Required water supplies” _is lierby amended by adding a

new subsection 508.1.1 thereto entitled “Fire line Construction’ to read as follows:

308.1 Fire Line Construction. The fire line, from the contro! valve at the main to the flange
within the building shall be constructed of ductile iron pipe (350) unless otherwise permitted

by the fire code official.

International Fire Code, Chapter 5 Section 508.3.1 entitled “Fire Service Features;

Fire Protection Water Supplies; Fire iydrant systems; Where required” is herby

B: 074 P: 475
Revised on 09/11/2012 I WG PR ol e WY i, B




[5s}

1~
[ R

b
LFH)

amended to read as follows:

308.5.1 Where required. Where a portion of the facility or building hereafter
constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction is more than 400 feet from a hydrant
on a fire apparatus access road, as measured by an approved route around the exterior of
the facility or building, onsite fire hydrants and mains capable of supplying the required
fire flow, shall be provided where required by code official. Additional fire hydrants may

be required when buildings are equipped with fire department connections.

International Fire Code, Chapter 5 Section 508.5.1 entitled “Fire Service Features;

Fire Protection Water Supplies; Fire hydrant systems; Where required” is hereby

amend exceptions to read as follows:

308.5.1 Where required.

Exceptions:

1. For Group R-3 and Group U occupancies, the distance requirement shall be 500

feet (150 m).

o

For buildings equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system
instailed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2, the distance

requirement shall be 500 feet (150 m).

B: 074 P. 476
RO APl B L A 11

Revised on 09/11/2012



2

53]

Ln

International Fire Code, Chapter 5, section 508.5.1 entitled “ Fire Service Features;

Fire Protection Water Supplies; Fire Hydrant Systems”  is hereby amended by adding

a new subsection 508.1.1 therete entitled “ Fire Protection in Recreational Vehicle,

Mobile home and Manufactured Housing Parks, Sales Lots, and Storage Lots” to read

as follows:

308.5.1.1 Fire Protection in Recreational Vehicle, Mobile Home and Manufactured Housing
Parks, Sales Lots. and Storage Lots. Recreational vehicle, mobile home and manufactured
housing parks, sales lots and storage lots shall provide and maintain fire hydrants and access

roads in accordance with Sections 503 and 508 of the International Fire Code.

International Fire Code, Clapter 5 Section 508.5.4 entitled “Fire Service Feafures:

Fire Protection Water Supplies; Fire hvdrant systems; Obstructions” is hereby

amended to read as follows:

3068.5.4 Obstructions. Posts, fences, vehicles, growth, trash, storage, and other material
or objects shall not be placed or kept near fire hydrants, fire department inlet connections,
or fire protection system control valves in a manner that would prevent such equipment
or fire hydrant from being immediately discernible. The fire department shall not be
deterred from gaining immediate access to fire protection equipment and fire hydrants.
Parking shall not be permitted within 15 feet of a fire hydrant, fire department inlet
connection, or fire protection systems control valves, except as otherwise approved by the

fire code official.

B: 074 P: 477
B R AT A2 P 11

Revised on 09/11/2012



tJ

International Fire Code, Chapter 5 Section 510.1 entitled “Fire Service Features; Fire

Departinent Access to Equipment; ldentification” is hereby amended to read as

follows:

310.1 Ideniificarion. Fire Protection equipment, and accessory rooms as deemed
necessary by the fire code official, shall be identified in an approved manner. Rooms
containing controls for air- conditioning systems, sprinkler risers, and vales, or other fire
detection, suppression or control elements shall be identified for the use of the fire
department. Approved signs required to identify fire protection equipment and equipment
location shall be constructed of durable materials, permanently installed, and readily

visible.

International Fire Code, Chapter 6 Section 607 entitled “Building Services and

systems; Elevator recall and Maintenance” is hereby amended by adding a new

subsection 607.4 thereto entitled “ communications” to read as follows:

607 4 Conmmunications. All elevators shall be equipped with two-way communication

equipment and the equipment shall be operabfe at all times.

Iuternational Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 901 entitled “Fire Protection systems:;

General; Coustruction Document’s” is hereby amended by adding a new paragrapl

at the end thereof to read as follows:

B: 074 P: 478
Revized an 0511112012 B AT 1A Rt ATl B




[oS

L

901.2 Construction Documents. Automatic sprinkler systems designed in accordance
with NFPA 13 shall be reviewed and submitted bearing a review certification and

signature of a minimum [evel I1I NICET Certified Engineering Technician (CET).

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 901.4.2 enfitled “Fire Protection svstenis;

General; Non-required fire protection systems” is liereby amended to read as follows:

901.4.2 Non-required fire profection systems. Any fire protection system not required by
this code or the International Building Code shall be installed throughout a building for
complete protection. The installed system shall meet the requirements of the Fire Code

and the International Building Code.

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 901.7 entitled “Fire Protection systens;

General; Systems ont of service” is hereby amended to read as follows:

90{.7 Systems out of service. Where a required fire protection system is out of service,
the Fire Department shall be notified immediately and when required by the Fire Code
official, the building shall have an approved fire watch in place until the fire protection
system is placed back in service. The fire Code Official may require the building to be

evacuated until such repairs are made.

Iuternational Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 902.1 entitled “Fire Protection Systems;

_ . Q74 P: 479
Revised on 09/11/2012 B e %f 4l ﬂ':MFlT PR T mmlq:upliuaah

il I




a

17

18

19

Defiuitions; is liereby amended by adding the following definitions thereto:

902.1 Definitions.

Detached buildings: A separate stand alone structure that is separate from other
buildings by an approved distance in accordance with the requirements of the building
code.

Existing Building: A building, structure, or facility, which is already in existence and
constructed prior to the adoption of this code.

Speculative Warehouse: A building designed for high piled combustible storage within a

known commedity designation specified.

International Fire Code, Chapter 9, Section 902.1 entitled * Fire Protection Systems;

Definitions; Standpipe System, Classes of” is hereby amended to add the following

definition thereto:

Class Il System. A system providing a 1.5-inch (38mm) hose stations to supply water for
use primarily for the building occupants or by the fire department during initial response. 1.5-
inch (38mm) hose and hose cabinets shall not be provided unless required by the code
official.

Class IIl System. A system providing a 1.5-inch (38mm) hose stations to supply water
for use primarily for the building occupants or by the fire department during initial response.
1.5-mch (38mm) hose and hose cabinets shall not be provided unless required by the code
official.

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 903.2 entitled “Fire Protection Systems;

Automatic Sprinkler Systems: Where required” is hereby amended by adding new

Revised on 09/11/2012 -l H’JF.'I'!E'*F.'.%.;'H‘!'.'HI.I."H 1 ll".'*.F*uf.hHJ!'.'l AAARTTY

B: 074 P: 480




I

(5]

14

15

e

17

paragraphs thereto, to read as foliows:

903.2 Where required. In addition to the requirements of the fire and building codes, an
approved automatic monitored sprinkler system shall be installed throughout all levels of all new
Group B, E, F, M, R-3, U, and S occupancies 6,000 square feet or greater and in all buildings
over 3 stories in height (including basements) regardless of the total square footage. In Group R-
3 occupancies, the calculated area shall include all livable and unfinished space and the area of
any attached garage. The garage space shall be included in the protected area.

Exceptions:

All Group R-1, R-2, and R-4 occupancies shall have an approved automatic sprinkler system
installed regardless of the square footage.

All Group A occupancies shall have an approved automatic sprinkler system installed where
there is an occupant load of 50 or greater.

Automatic sprinkler systems in R-3 and U occupancies shall not be required to be monitored.
Such systems shall be in accordance with the International Fire Code, International Building
Code, and installed 1n accordance with NFPA 13, 13D, or 13R as specified by the fire code
official.

Notwithstanding the foregoing an automatic monitored fire sprinkler system may be installed

in any building regardiess of floor area.

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 903.2.1 entitled “ Fire Protection Systems:

Automatic Sprinkler Systems; Where required” Group A-1:” is hereby amended by

amending item #2.

B: 074 P: 481
Revised on 09/11/2012 B W A KT L B, B




I

Ly

-2
8]

b
L2

903.2.1.1 Group A-1.
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 50 or greater.

Intcrnational Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 903.2.1.2 entitled “ Fire Protection Systems:

Automatic Sprinkler Systems; Where required” Group A-2:” is hereby amended by

amending item #2,

903.2.1.2 Group 4-2.

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 50 or more; or

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 903.2.1.3 entitled “ Fire Protection Systems:

Automatic Sprinkler Systems; Where required” Group A-3:” is hereby amended by

amending item #2,

903.2.1.3 Group A-3.

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 50 or more; or

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 903.2.1.4 entitled “ Fire Protection Systems:

Automatic Sprinkler Svstems; Where required” Group A-4:” is herebv amended by

amending item #2,

903.2.1.4 Group 4-4.

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 50 or more; or

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 903.2.1.5 entitled “ Fire Protection Systems:

Automatic Sprinkler Systems; Where required” Group A-5:” is hereby amended to read

| . 074 P: 482
ronsedon IR H.“'.r!.‘!%r‘:‘lﬁa‘l’ilf: NPy AT PUPMLA i, B



2

L3

as follows:

903.2.1.5 Group A-3. An automatic monitored sprinkler system shall be provided in

concession stands, retail areas, press boxes, and other accessory use areas where the occupant

load 1s 50 or greater.

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 903.2.2 entitled “ Fire Protection Systems;

Automatic Sprinkler Systems; Where required” Group E:” is hereby amended to read as

follows:

903.2.2 Group E. An automatic monitored sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all
Group E fire areas 6,000 square feet and greater in area. An automatic monitored sprinkler
system shall also be provided for every portion of educational buildings above or below the level

of exit discharge.

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 903.2.3 entitled “ Fire Protection Systems;

Automatic Sprinkler Systems; Where required” Group F-1:” is hereby amended bv

adding a new item number 1-3, to read as follows:

903.2.3 Group F-1.
1. Where a Group F fire area is 6,000 square feet or greater;

2. Where a Group I fire area is located more than 3 stories in height (including basements);

Revised on 09/11/2012 B: 074 P 483

R LA AT 0 AR




S8

Ll

or
3. Where the combined area of all Group F fire area on all floors, including any mezzanines

and basements, is 6,000 square feet or greater.

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 903.2.6 entitled “ Fire Protection Systems:

Automatic Sprinkler Systems; Where required” Group M:” is hereby amended by adding

the following at the end of the paragraph:

903.2.6 Group M.

1. Where a Group M fire area is 6,000 square feet or greater;

2. Where a Group M fire area is located more than three stories in height (inciuding
Basements)

3. Where the combined area of all Group M fire area on all floors, including mezzanines

and basements, 6,000 square feet or greater.

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 903.2.7 entitled “ Fire Protection Systems:

Automatic Sprinkler Systems: Where required” Group R:” is hereby amended to read as

follows:

903.2.7 Group R. An automatic sprinkfer system installed in accordance with Section 903.3
shall be provided throughout all buildings with a Group R fire area. In group R-3 occupancies
6.000 square feet or greater, an automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout in
accordance with Section 903.2 and 903.3.

R-3 and U occupancies less than 6,000 square feet shall be required to have an automatic
sprinkler system installed when any of the following apply;

| B: 074 P: 484
Revised on 09/112012 | MR RVEH AL LRl b W,



19
!\J

(WS

The fire department access roads do not meet the requirements of the Fire code.

The building is focated in a subdivision without adequate fire apparatus access roads,

which provide multiple ingress and egress points from the subdivision.

The building site is located on a dead-end and exceeds 1,500 feet from the nearest

thoroughfare’s intersection.

. The fire department access road is greater than a 12% grade.

A fire hydrant is more than 1000 feet from the building site or the required fire flow is

not available.

The most remote point of a building is located more than 150 feet from the closest point

of a fire apparatus access roadways as measured by an approved route around the exterior

of the building.

Exception.

1. Detached one and two family dwellings under 3,000 square feet.

2. Manufactured (Mobile) and modular homes build on a permanent chassis designed
and built as a dwelling unit and recreational vehicles that were not site built and are

portable in nature.

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 903.2.8 entitled “ Fire Protection Systems:

Automatic Sprinkler Systems; Where required” Group S-1:” is hereby amended to read as

follows;

903.2.8 Group S-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all buildings

containing a Group S-1 occupancy, including repair garages, that are greater than 6,000 sq. ft

| B: 074 p:
Revised on 09/11/2012 B BT o o it ﬁrﬂ LT o )



b

I~
Gl

(557 sq, m) within surrounding exterior walls and /or where three stories (including basements)
or more in height, or where the combined square footage on all floors including mezzanines, and

basements is greater than 6,000 sq, fi. within surrounding exterior walls.

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 903 entitled “ Fire Protection Systems:

Automatic Sprinkler Systems; is hereby amended by adding a new subseetion 903.2.9.1.2

thereto entitled” Open parking garages” to read as follows:

903.2.9.1.2 Open parking garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
all open parking garages as defined in the International Building Code where any portion is
greater than 75 ft from an exterior opening. At least one exterior opening shall be directly

accessible by fire apparatus.

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 903.2.10 entitled “ Fire Protection Systems:

Automatic Sprinkler Systems; Where required” windowless stories in all occupaneies” is

hereby deleting the exception thereto,

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 903 entitled “ Fire Protection Systems:

Automatic Sprinkler Systems; is hereby amended by adding a new subsection903.2.14

thereto entitled” Fire Protection Systems; Automatic Sprinkler Systems: Where Required:

Group B,” to read as follows:

Section 903.2.14 Group B. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all

| B: 074 P: 486
Revised on 09/11/2012 B AR o A, Bl B AL i,



19

(%3

o
(%)

Group B occupancies where any of the following exist:

1. Where Group B fire area is 6,000 square feet and greater, or

]

Where Group B fire area is three stories in height including basement, or

Where the combined square footage on all floors including mezzanines, and basements is

(%]

6,000 square feet.

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 903.3.1.3 entitled “ Fire Protection Systems:

Automatic Sprinkler Systems; Installation requircments; NFPA 13D sprinkler systems” is

hereby amended to read as follows:

903.3.1.3 NFPA 13D sprinkler system. Where allowed, automatic sprinkler systems in one and
two family dwellings shall be installed throughout in accordance with NFPA 13D, 901.2.1 and
this code. Automatic sprinkler systems designed in accordance with NFPA 13D shall be
reviewed and submitted bearing a review certification and signature of a minimum fevel 111
NICET Certified Engineering Technician (CET). NFPA 13D systems shall include sprinklers in
vehicle garages. Automatic sprinkler systems shall be provided throughout a fire area continuing
Group R-3 occupancy where the fire area exceeds 6,000 square feet. Systems greater than 7,500
square feet in size shall be calculated based on four sprinklers and a Fire Department Connection

(FDC) shall be provided per the Fire Code Official.

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 903.3.5 entitled “ Fire Protection Systems:

Automatie Sprinkler Systems; Installation Requirements; Water supplies” is hereby

B: 074 P: 487
Revised on 09/112012 g WA RAMRg AU PRI R RAVLIT el 1)




b

amended by adding a new subsection 903.3.5.3 hereto entitled *“ Water requirements” to

read as follows:

903.3.3.3 Water Requirements. Automatic sprinkler system hydraulic calculations shall be
based on water supply data curve that is 90 percent of the available water supply curve (10%

Cushion), as determined by flow test information and at a maximum of 80 p.s.i.

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 903.3.7 entitled “ Fire Protection Systems:

Automatic Sprinkler Systems; Installation Requirements: Fire Department

Connections” is hereby amended by adding 2 new paragraph at the end of the section to

rcad as follows:

903.3.7 Fire Department Connections. The location of the fire department connection shall
be located remotely at a distance no less than 1 % times the height of the tallest wall.
Exception: If public access ways prohibit required distance, the fire department connection

must still be remotely located at a distance approved by the Fire Code Official.

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 903.3 entitled “ Fire Protection Systems;

Automatic Sprinkler Systems; Installation Requirements”; is hereby amended by

adding a new subsection 903.3.8 entitled “ Speculative warehouse special requirements”

B: 074 P: 488
Revised on 097112012 | A/ FARN (T LM L A E T et B 1




a

L)

thereto, to read as follows:

903.3.8 Speculative Warehouse Special Requirements. Speculative Warehouse shall comply
with Chapter 23, and this code. Where the maximum allowable storage height can exceed 12
feet but less than 22 feet the following shall apply:
1. Design for a class IV non-encapsulated commodity, double row rack storage, 8 foot aisles and
286 degree sprinklers; and
2. Hydraulically designed to protect the maximum possible clear height or storage without in-
rack sprinklers; and
3. Add 500 g.p.m. at the base of the riser for inside hose to hydraulic calculations, and provide
the hose stub outs for future installation or use existing columns for hose installing locations.
Where the maximum allowable storage heiglit can exceed 22 feet the following shall apply:
I. Hydraulically design systems to protect the maximum possible clear height of storage

without in-rack sprinklers; and

D

Provide .64 g.p.m. per square foot over the hydraulically most remote 2,000 square feet;

or use an approved alternative design such as ESFR sprinklers.

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 903.3 entitled “ Fire Protection Systems;

Automatic Sprinkler Systems; Installation Requirements; is hereby amended by adding a

new subsection 303.3.9 entitled “ Access to fire sprinkler riser room” thereto, to read as

follows:

B: 074 P. 489
B P Ao T Rt M B0

Revised on 09/11/2012



[0

[*¥]

n

903.3.9 Access to fire sprinkler riser room. An exterior door leading directly into the room
containing the fire sprinkler riser and shut off controls shall be provided.
Exception. Where an approved alternate method of controlling the sprinkler water supply

from the outside of the structure is provided and is accessible to the fire department.

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 903.4 entitled “ Fire Protection Systems:

Automatic Sprinkler Svstems: Sprinkler system meonitorine and alarms” is hereby

amended by deleting exception number 2 thereto.

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 903.4.2 entitled “ Fire Protection Systems:

Automatic Sprinkler Systems; Sprinkler systems monitoring and alarms; Alarms” s

hereby amended by adding a new subsection 903.4.2.1 entitled “ Qccupant notification”

thereto, to read as follows:

903.4.2.1 Occupant Notification. Alarm devises to alert the occupants shall be provided in
the interior of the building, in normally occupied locations, as approved by the Fire Code
Official.

Occupant notification alarms shall be 1n compliance with NFPA 72 and the Fire Code.

B: 074 p:
] T e F#J.-Ifi*:lﬂ:ﬂiﬂﬁ?f! 9 o I

Revised on 09/11/2012



2]

[¥E)

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 903.6 entitled “ Fire Protection Systems:

Automatic Sprinkler Systems; Existing Building: is hereby amended to read as follows:

903.6 Existing Buildings. The provisions of this section are intended to provide a reasonable
degree of safety in existing structures not complying with the minimum requirements of the
International Building Code by requiring installation of an automatic fire-extinguishing systen.

An approved automatic monitoring fire extinguishing system shall be provided throughout all
existing building when any of the following occur:

1. Any addition that increases the total floor area to 6,000 square feet or greater including

mezzanines, and basements, or

0]

Any change of use to a portion of the building to an Assembly Occupancy where the

occupant load is 50 or greater, or

sl

A change or use 1s made to any building with a total floor area of 6,000 feet or greater
including mezzanines and basements.

Exception: R-3 Occupancies.

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 section 904.11 entitled “Fire Protection Systems;

Alternative Automatic Fire- Extinguishing Systems; Commercial Cooking Systems” is

herebv amended by deleting the exception.

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 907.1.1 entitled “ Fire Protection Systems:

Alarm and Detection Systems; Construction Documents”; is hereby amended by adding a

| . 074 P: 491
Revised on 09/11/2012 B R TR Y S I M i, 2011



b

L2

n

new item number 12 thereto, to read as follows:

907.1.1 Construction Documents.
12. All plans shall be designed and stamped by minimum NICET Level III Fire Protection

Engineering Technology. fire Alarm certified personnel.

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 Scction 907.2 entitled “ Fire Protection Systems;

Firc Alarm and Detection Systems; Where required “ is hereby amended to read as

follows:

907.2 Where required — new building and structures. An approved manual, automatic, or
manual and automatic fire alarm system shall be provided in new buildings and structures in
accordance with Section 907.2.1 through 907.2.23. Where automatic sprinkler protection
installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.2 is provided and connected to the building alarm
system, automatic heat detection required by this section shall not be required.

Where automatic sprinkler protection is provided, approved fire alarm system notification
appliances shall be installed in all occupancies over 6,000 square feet of floor area and in all
buildings over three stories in (including basements) regardless of total square footage.

All fire alarm installations shall be installed by a minimum NICET Level III Fire Protection
Engineering Technology, Fire Alarm Systems certified persons or factory-trained and certified
personnel.

Exception: Group R-3 occupancies

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 907.2.1 entitled “ Fire Protection Systems:

evised an 2012 ®74 P 492
I A B B



b

Ll

Firc Alarm and Detcction Systems; Where required new building and structures; Group

A is hercby amended by adding a new subsection 907.2.1.3 entitled * Audibility in new

and existing buildings”: thereto, to read as follows:

907.2.1.3 Audibility in new and existing buildings. To ensure that audible public mode
signals are clearty heard, a fire afarm system shall be arranged to stop or reduce ambient noise,

when required by the code official.

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 907.20.5 entitled “ Fire Protection Systems:

Fire Alarm and Detcction Systems; Inspections, testing, and maintenance; Maintenance,

inspection and testing” js hereby amended by adding a new subsection 207.20.5.1 entitled “

Qualified Personnel” thereto, to read as follows:

907.20.5.1 Qualified Personnel. Maintenance, inspection, and testing shall be conducted by
persons who are qualified and experienced. Maintenance, inspection and testing of alarm systems
shall be conducted by minimum NICET Leve! III Fire Protection Engineering Technology, Fire

Alarm Systems certified persons, or factory trained and certified personnel.

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 Section 907.20 entitled “ Fire Protection Systems:

Fire Alarm and Detection Systems; Inspections, testing, and maintenanee; is hereby

amended by adding a new subsection 907.20.6 entitled “ Required Monitoring ” thercto, to

read as follows:

907.20.6 Required Monitoring. When required by the Fire Code Official, fire alarm systems
shall be monitored by an approved central, proprietary, or remote station. Owners/tenants of

B: 074 P: 493

Revised on 09/11/2012 !m H}f J”lﬁt}!“;tniq:!qﬂ‘ hil'ﬁ Hfr;lp,‘.fuwHLU'H*;H‘,‘}, m




[ 3%

L

i
[Re]

1
Ll

building with required fire alarm systems must report upon request from the fire department,
the name and location of the monitoring company for that system. The Fire Code Official
shall be notified within 24 hours of any change or cancellation by the monitoring company of

any changes thereto.

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 section 909.8.1 is amended to the following

Exhaust rate. The height of the lowest horizontal surface of the accumulating smoke layer
shall be maintained at least 6 ft above any walking surface, which forms a portion of a
required egress system within the smoke zone. The required exhaust rate for the zone shall be
the largest of the calculated plume mass flow rates for the possible plume configuratjons.
Provisions shall be made for natural or mechanical supply of air exhausted. Makeup airflow
rates, when measured at the potential fire [ocation, shall not exceed 200 feet per minute
(60960 mm per minute) toward the fire. The temperature of the makeup air shall be such that

it does not expose temperature-sensitive {ire protection systems beyond their limits.

International Fire Code, Chapter 9 sections 909.9 shall be amended to the following.

909.9 Design Fire. The design fire shall be based on a rational analysis performed by a
registered design professional and approved by the code official. The design fire shall be

based on the analysis in accordance with Section 909.4 and this section.

International Fire Code, Chapter 10 Section 1008.1 entitled *“ Means of Egress: Doors,

o B: 074 P: 494
Revied on 091112012 B BT B YLl WA b B




i

w

J
[}

28]
[

Gates and Turnstiles; Doors” is hereby amended by adding a new paragraph at the end of

the section thereto, to read as follows:

1008.1 Doors: When required by the Fire Code Official, a sign shall be displayed
permanently on the exterior of the exit door(s) in letters not less than 6 inches in height with

a minimum stroke of .5 inches with a contrasting background to read as follows:

“EXIT DOORS DO NOT OBSTRUCT”

International Fire Code, Chapter 10 Section 1011.1 entitled Where required” is

hereby amended by adding a new sentence at the end of the section thereto, to read as

follows:
1011.1 Where required: Floor proximity exit signs are required in R-1 occupancies having

more than 2 stories in height.

International Fire Code, Chapter 14 Section 1410 entitled “ Fire Safety During

Construction and Demolition; Access for Fire Fighting” is hereby amended by adding a
4 I

new subsection 1410.3 entitled” Access road and sisnage” thereto, to read as follows:

1410.3 Access road and signage. During construction, approved signs shall be located to
direct emergency responders into and through the construction site as required by the Fire

Code Official.

. 074 P: 495
B B 1A i qled e AR e, 811

Revised on 09/11/2012



(1]

il

International Fire Code, Chapter 24 section 2404.12 entitled “Tents, Canopies, and

other Membrane Structures: Temporary and Permanent Tents, Canopies, and other

Membrane Struetures; Portable fire extinguishers” is herebv amended to read as

follows,
2404.12 Portable Fire Extinguishers. A portable fire extinguisher shall be provided for
every 400 square feet of tent, canopy, or membrane structure with a trave! distance of 50

feet.
Exception: Tents. canopies, or membrane structures not used for cooking or with

no open {flame may increase area to 800 square feet and a travel distance of 75 feet.

International Fire Code, Chapter 27 Section 2702.1 entitled “Hazardous Material-

General Provisions; Definition; Secondary Containment” is hereby amended to read as

follows:

Secondary Containment. That level of containment that is external to and separate from
primary containment and 1s capable of safely and securely containing the material.
without discharge, for a period of time reasonable necessary to ensure detection and

remedy of the primary containment failure.

International Fire Code, Chapter 33 section 3301.1.3 delete exception # 2.

International Fire Code, Chapter 33 Section 3301.2.4 entitled “Explosives and

Fireworks; General; Permit Required; Financial Responsibility” is hereby amended to

| B: 074 P: 496
Revisedan O9/1IB0I2 | DR LT L i AR




i)

L)

read as follows;

3301.2.4 Financial Responsibility. Before a permit is issued, as required by Section 3301.2
the applicant shall file with the County of Valencia a surety bond in the principal sum of
$1,000,000.00 (one million dollars} or a public liability insurance policy for the same amount,
for the purpose of payment of all damages to persons or property which arise from, or are caused
by, the conduct of any act authorized by the permit upon which any judicial judgment results.
The Fire Code Official is authorized to specify a greater or [esser amount when, in his or her
opinion, conditions at the location of use indicate a greater or lesser amount is required.

Exception: Government Entities.

International Fire Code, Chapter 33 Section 3301 entitled * Explosives and Fireworks:

General;_is hereby amended by adding a new subsection 3301.9 through 3301.11 thereto,

read as follows:

3301.9 Plans. Three (3) days prior to temporary storing of explosive material within the
jurisdiction a scale drawing of the proposed storage site, noting closest inhabited dwellings,
structure, utilities, and public right of ways shall be submitted to the Fire Code Official for
review and an on-site inspection shall be conducted prior to approval. The magazine and site
shall meet the requirements of the American Table of Distances.

3301.10 Fees. Fees shall be paid to the Valencia County Emergency Services at the time of
the request for any permit.

3301.11 Permit Requirements. When applying for a permit to use or store explosive

B: 074 P
Revisedon o/112012 ) FA”JF‘&IP&Hflﬂ:f-ﬂ'fﬁhl.'lf.h':-ﬁﬂff#‘ﬁ%ﬂ'h-if%Hss*. i



i~

il

1~
Ud

materials with Valencia County, the contractor shall conform to the policy set by Valencia

County Fire Marshal.

International Fire Code, Chapter 33 Section 3302.1 entitled “ Explosives and

Fireworks; Definitions; Definitions” is hereby amended by adding the following definitions

thereto:

Attend. Is an unobstructed view of explosive material storage or within 100 feet of an
explosive matertal transportation vehicle.

Permanent. Shall mean more than 90 days but less than 360 days.

Temporary. Shall mean no more than 90 days.

International Fire Code, Chapter 33 Section 3304 entitled “ Explosives and Fireworks,

Explosive Material Storage and Handling” is herebv amended by adding a new subsection

3304.3.1.1 thereto entitled “Monitoring of Tvpe I and II Magazines” to read as follows:

3304.2.1.1 Monitoring of Type I and If Magazines”

An automatic alarm system shall be provided in all type I and II magazines. The alarm
system shall be remotely monitored and shall be activated when there is unauthorized entry
into the magazine, and when there is a rise in the temperature in the magazine that could
cause the explosive material stored in the magazine to detonate or to deflagrate.

The alarm system shall be in accordance with the provision of section 907.20.6 NFPA 72,

and other recognized national standards.

B: 074 P: 498
LR T O] ey

Revised on 09/11/2012



™~

International Fire Code, Chapter 33 Section 3304.9 entitled “Explosives and Fireworks,

Explasive Material Storage and Handling; inspection” is hereby amended to read as

[WX)

4 follews:
5
6 3304.9 Inspections. Magazines containing explosive material shall be opened and inspected
7 at maximum three-day intervals. The inspection shall determine whether there has been an
8 unauthorized or attempted entry into a magazine or an unauthorized removal or a magazine
9 or its contents.
10
i
12 International Fire Code, Chapter 33 Section 3304 entitied “Explosives and Fireworks,
13 Explesive Material Storage and Handling” is hereby amended by adding a new
14 subsections 3304.11 through 3304.21 thereto, to read as follows:
13
i6 3304.11 Loading of Holes. Explosive material shall not be toaded into the ground until the
17 Fire Code Official issues a valid use permit and the permit holder is on site.
18 3304.12 Signage. Provide and install signs reading “BLASTING ZONE AHEAD?” and
19 “TURN OFF 2_WAY RADIOS” when explosive material use is proposed within 300 feet of
20 public rights-of-way.
21 3304.13 Attendance. The permit holder shall be on site when the explosive material are
22 loaded into the ground and shall remain on site until the blasting operation is complete.
23 330.14 Written notification. 'The contractor, at the discretion of the permit holder may

B: 074 P: 499

Revised on 09/11/2012 I B R o AT Tl Pl PR e B



-2

[F5)

provide verbal notification to the owner/occupant and written notification in their absence, of
cach building or structure within a 300-foot radius of the blast site prior to the use of
explosive materials or as otherwise required by the Fire Code Official.

3304.15 Scaled distance. When building are located within a 300-foot radius of a blast site
the scaled distance factor of fifty shall be used in order to limit the peak particle velocity
(PPV). A pre-blast survey, seismic or air biast monitoring may also be required at the
discretion of the Fire Code Official. When seismic monitoring is conducted refer to NFPA
493, “Frequency vs. Particle Velocity Graph.” When air blast monitoring is conducted, the
maximmum reading allowed is 133 decibels (db) as referred to in NFPA 495, Air blast Limits
Table.

3304.16 Blasting log. The permit holder shall maintain a blasting log. The log shall contain
the follJowing minimum date as applicable. Blasting logs shall be retained for at least five (5)
years and when requested, a copy of the blasting [og shall be submitted to the Fire Code
Official.

1. Name of Company or contractor,

. Fire Department Permit number,

2

[FB]

. Exact location of the blast site, date and time of detonation,

4. Type of material blasted,

Ln

. Number of holes, burden and spacing,

0. Diameter and depth of hole,

7. Types and totaf amount of each explosive used,

8. Maximum amount of explosives and holes detonated within each §-millisecond delay

period,

B: 074 P: 500
B R, A SR s

Revised on 09/11/2012



LS

17

18

19

9. Method of firing and type of circuit,

10. Direction, distance in feet, and identification of the nearest dwelling, house, public
building, school, church, commercial or institutional building,

11. Weather conditions,

12. Type and height of stemming,

13. Statement of whether fly-rock protection was used and type,

14. Type of delays and delay period in milliseconds,

15. Seismograph records when used:

a. Name of operator

b. Distance and direction of geophone and mic {rom blast

¢c. Seismograph calibration certification

d. seismograph reading

16. Plan view drawing of blast pattemn showing layout and number of holes, burden, and
spacing distance, delay pattern, and a profile of typical loaded hole.

3304.17 Marked items. Any remaining explosive operation items or device marked
EXPLOSIVE or BLASTING CAP shall be removed from the site at the end of the day and
properly disposed of in accordance with the Fire Code and nationally recognized standards.
3304.18 Transfer of material between vehicles, breakdown or collision. Explosive materials
shall not be transferred from one vehicle to another within Valencia County without
informing the Fire Code Official first. In the event of a breakdown or collision of vehicles
transporting explosives materials, the Fire Chief shall be immediately notified.

3304.19 Parking and garaging. Vehicles transporting explosive material shall not be parked

before reaching its destination on any street, adjacent to or in the proximity of any bridge,

074 P:
Revised on 09/11/2012 .m EEFJF“FHI:':HEHE'. M"EI.II.P%':’E‘?;H{H;WE‘ *H':II H’:’l‘r I! ’”



R

w)

17

18

19

tunnel, dwelling, building or place where people work, congregate or assembly.

3304.20 Temporary storage — up to 90 days. As defined in Chapter 33, temporary storage
(up to 90 days) may be allowed by the Fire Code Official and shall be placed in an approved
magazine for storage of explosives and explosive material and shall comply with Section
3504.5.1 through 3304.5.3.3

3304.21 Permanent storage — 90 to 360 days. As defined in Chapter 33 (over 90 days but
less than 360) may be allowed by the Fire Code Official and shall be placed in an approved
magazine for the storage of explosives and explosive material and shall comply with Section

3304.5.1 through 3304.5.3.3

International Fire Code, Chapter 33 Section 3305 _entitled “ Explosives and Fireworks,

Manufacture, Assembly and Testing or Explosives, Explosive Material, and Fireworks” is

hereby deleted in its entirety, to be replaced with a new section 3305, to read as follows:

Scction 3305 Manufacture, Assembly and Testing or Explosives, Explosive Materials,

and Fireworks.

3303.1 General: The manufacture, assembly and testing of explosives, ammunition, blasting
agents, explosive materials, and fireworks shall not be conducted within Vaiencia County.

Exceptions:

1. The hand oading of small arms ammunition prepared for personal use and not offered for

resale.

o]

The mixing and loading of blasting sites in accordance with NFPA 495.

The use of binary explosives or plosophoric materials in blasting or pyrotechnic special

[

effects applications in accordance with NFPA 495 or NFPA 1126.

| B: 074 P: 502
Revised on 09/11/2012 | Wl My YV MUl ok et e, L1



[Re]

[

Ln

International Fire Code, Chapter 33 Section 3307.1 entitled “ Explosives and

Fireworks, Blasting; General” is hereby amended by adding new subsection 3307.1.1

through 3307.1.5 thereto, to read as follows:

3307.1.1 Competency. A competent person possessing a valid permuit issued by the Valencia
County Fire Department shall be in charge of magazines. The person shall be at {east 21 years of
age and responsibie for compliance with all regulatory agencies.

3307.1.2 Personnel Qualifications. The person in charge of the use, possession,
manufacturing, handling or transporting or explosives material within Valencia County shall be
at least 21 years of age.

3307.1.3 Intoxicants. Explosive materials shall not be handled by persons under the
mifluence of intoxicants or any drug as defined in New Mexico Statue, or its metabolics.

3307.1.4 New Mexico Revised Statues. Vehicles used to transport explosive materials in
quantities requiring placards in accordance with DOT shall be provided with liability insurance
in compliance with Revised New Mexico Statutes.

3307.1.5 Abandonment. Explosive material or loaded holes shall not be left unattended at

any tume.

International Fire Code, Chapter 3308.11 entitled Explosives and Fireworks; Fireworks

Displavs; Retail displays and sale, is herebv deleted and replaced with the following.

B: 074 P: 503
Revised on 091112012 | WY Pt LA W G P i B




[

(¥

Lh

3308.11 Retail Sales and Storage of Fireworks; Reoulated Activity,

Retail Sales and Storage of Fireworks; Regulated Activity

1) Fireworks may not be sold without a retail permit. A permit shall be issued for each
location where the sale takes place.

2) It is unlawful to offer for sale any firework to children under the age of twelve or to any
intoxicated person.

3) At places where fireworks are stored, sold, or displayed the words “No Smoking” shall
be posted in letters at least four inches high. Smoking, open flames and ignition sources
are prohibited within twenty-five (25) feet of any fireworks stock. The number and
placement of “Ne Smoking” signs may be determined by the * Fire Marshal” or
designated agents of the “Fire Marshal”

4) Fireworks may not be stored. kept, sold or discharges within fifty (50) feet of any
gasoline pump, or gasoline bulk station, or any building in which gasoline or vofatile
liquids are sold in quantities in excess of one gallon, except in stores where cleaners,
paints, and oils are handled in sealed container.

5) All Fireworks permits and licensees shall keep, posted, and maintain upon each premises
where fireworks are located a fire extinguisher bearing an Underwriters Laboratories Inc.
label and with a rated capacity of at least 5lbs ABC per five hundreds (500) square feet of
space used for fireworks sales and storage.

6) A sales attendant who is at least sixteen (16) years of age must be on duty to serve
consumers at the time of purchase and delivery. All fireworks sold and shipped to

consumers within Valencia County shall be sold and shipped only by an individual firm,

| B: 074 P: 504
Revised on 09/11/2012 R o Tl Tk M S PO i




[

(%)

1]
(%)

partnership, or corporation holding the proper Valencia County fireworks license or
permit.

7} Fireworks shall not be discharged within one hundred and fifty (150) feet of any
fireworks sales location.

8) Fireworks shall not be ignited within a motor vehicle and shall not be thrown from a
motor vehicle. Fireworks shall not be thrown into or at a motor vehicle, or into, at or near
any person, or group of persons.

9) All fireworks devices that are readily accessible to handling by consumers or purchasers
in retail sales locations must have their exposed fuses protected in such a manner as to
protect against accidental ignition of an item by spark, cigarette ash, or other ignition
source. If the fuse is a threaded-wrapped safety fuse, which has been coated with a
nonflammable coating, only the outside end of the safety fuse shall be covered. If the fuse
is not a threaded-wrapped safety fuse, the entire fuse shall be covered.

10) Fireworks may be sold between June 20 and July 6 of each year and the three days
preceding and including New Year’s Day, Chinese New Year. and Cinco De Mayo of
each year.

Exception: Fireworks may be sold all year in permanent retail stores
whose primary business is tourism.

) No person may, shall, hold for sale, import, distribute, or offer for sale, as manufacturer,
distributor, wholesaler, or retail any fireworks in Valencia County unless such person has
first obtained the appropriate fireworks license or permit. All fireworks license or permit
applications shall be submitted to the Valencia County Emergency Services. All retailers

shall be required to purchase a retail fireworks license or permit for each retail [ocation.

. 505
Revised on 09/11/2012 T T R e i ]



™~

d) An application for a fireworks license or permit under the International Fire Code and
this ordinance shall pay to the Valencia County Emergency Services the following fees,

which shall not be waived or refunded:

1. Manufacturer License 550.00
2. Distributor License 525.00
3. Wholesaler License $25.00
4. Specialty Retailer License $25.00
5. Display Distributor License $25.00
0. Retailer Permit $25.00
e) All fireworks licenses and permits shall be issued for one year beginning on May 1 of

each year. All fireworks licenses and permits if approved shall be issued within thirty
days from the date of receipt of application.

f} Fireworks licenses and permits issued under the International Fire Code and this
ordinance shall not be restricted in number or limited to any person without cause.

g) Permissible fireworks for sale to the general public as that term is used in the
International Fire Code and this ordinance shall mean fireworks legal for sale and use in
New Mexico under the provisions of the Fireworks Safety and Licensing Act, Section 60-
2C et. seq. N.M.S.A. (1978).

Exception: acrial devices and ground devices.

Prohibition

a) All aenial devices and ground audible devices are prohibited and deemed non-
permissible. Individuals, firms, partnership, corporations, or associations shall not

possess for sale in Valencia County, sell. and offer to sell, use or possess any

B: 074 P. 506
Revised on 09/11/2012 W11 0P RO Lol R o T T i, 211



R

[F%)

Lh

fireworks other than permissible fireworks.

b) Nothing in the Fireworks Licensing and Safety Act, 60-2C-1 et. seq. N.M.S.A. (1978)
shall prohibit licensed wholesalers, distributors, importers, or manufacturers from
storing, selling, shipping, or otherwise transporting fireworks defined by the United
states Department of Transportation to any person or entity outside the Sate of New

Mexico.

Section 7. Appeals.

Whenever the code official disapproves an application or refuses to grant a permit
applied for, or which 1t is claimed that the provisions of this ordinance of the International Fire
Code do not apply or that the true intent and meaning of the International Fire Code and/or this
ordinance have been misconstrued or wrongly interpreted, the applicant may appeal the decision
of the code official to the “Board of Appeals” within 30 days from the date of the decision
appealed.

Section 8. Fees and Charges Programs.

8.1 Permit and Service Fees

Fees may be established by resolution of the Valencia County Commission for the
International Fire Code and the permits and services provided by the Valencia County
Emergency Services pursuant to this ordinance. The permit and service fees paid to the Valencia
County Emergency Services shall be deposited into the fire protection fund to be used by the
Valencia County Emergency Services for the purpose of enforcing and carrying out the
provisions and intent of the International Fire Code and this ordinance.

B: 074 P: 507
Revisd on 09112012 ) ) Mo PRl B




[

(53]

]
(RN

[Re
L)

8.2 Permits and Service Fees.

A fee shall be paid to Valencia County Emergency Services at the time of application for
(1) a RENEWABLE PERMIT, (2) an INSTALLATION or REMOVAL or ALTERATION
PERMIT, (3} PLAN REVIEW and (4) any ACTIVITY PERMIT, MISCELLANEQUS
SERVICE, (5) any RECORD, PHOTOGRAPHS, or DOCUMENTS, and (6) a HAZARDQUS
MATERIALS STORAGE PERMIT. Such fees shall not be refunded upon failure of applicant to
receive the permit. Failure to apply for a permit or service will result in an order from the Fire
Marshal to obtain such permit or service. Such an order shall be considered an application for the
necessary permit or service. Failure to pay for plan review or inspection fees within the time
period specified shall render such permit null and void.

EXCEPTION: Permit fees shall not apply to activities of non-profit corporations or
Civic fraternal organizations that are designated by the Internal Revenue Service as tax-exempt.
However, these groups shall be assessed plan review and inspections fees for retail sales permits.

Section 9. Penalties.

a) Any person who violates any provision of the International Fire Code or the
amendments to the code , or fails to comply therewith, violates or fails to comply with any order
made there under, builds a structure in violation of any detailed statement of specifications or
plans submitted and approved, or builds a structure in violation of any certificate or permit issued
there under, and from which no appeal has been taken, or who fails to comply with such an order
affirmed or modified by the “Board of Appeals” or by a court of competent jurisdiction, within
the tume fixed herein, shall severally for each such violation and noncompliance, respectively, be
guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable by fine of not more than $300.00 or by imprisonment for

not less than 30 days or more than 90 days or both such fine and imprisonment. The imposition

B: 074 P:
Revised on 09/11/2012 AR TG Wik Lo MAR U R, o, 11



3]

L

Lo
[

[
Ul

of one party for any violation shall not excuse the violation or perniit it to continue: and all such
persons are required to correct or remedy such violation or defects within a reasonable amount of
time; and when not otherwise specified, each ten days that prohibited conditions are maintained
shall constitute a separate offense.

b) The application of the above penalty shall not be held to prevent the enforced removal
of prohibited conditions.

Section 10. Conflicting Codes and Ordinances.

Where existing codes and ordinances, or parts thereof, are in conflict or inconsistent with

the provistons of this ordinance and the International Fire Code, the most restrictive shall apply.

Section 11. Severability.

The Board of County Commissioners hereby declares that should any section or
Proviston of this ordinance be declared invalid or unconstitutional by any court of
Competent jurisdiction, the declaration shall not affect the validity of this ordinance as a whole
or any part thereof that is not specifically declared to be invalid or unconstitutional.

Section 12. Date of Effect.

This ordinance and the International Fire Code shall take effect and be in force within

thirty (30) days after its final adoption as provided by law.

B: 074 P: 509
G| W TR NS AL o ot B

Revised on 09/11/2012



)

International Fire Code Board of Appeals
(Valencia County)
Authority: Valencia County Fire Code

Ordinance No.

Authority: The Board, upon hearing of an appeal, shall have the power to
reverse, affirm, or amend a Fire Department’s ordered time limit,
or decision of the Chief, or to grant variances from the provisions
of the Fire Code: provided that before reversing or amending such
order or decision, or authorizing such variance the Board shall first
find that strict enforcement of the ordered time limit or decision is
impractical, unwarranted, or creates an unnecessary hardship in
each instance. Such reversals, or amendments, or variances must
be in conformance with the spirit and intent of this code and must
reasonably secure the public safety.

Membership

B: 074 P: 510
Revised on 09/11/2012 B PN R L ) Bl G o, 1



]

L98)

|55 J £ N N0 R (N T NG IR (N6 TR NG I N [ N T N QR
[ N o R - < L = T e O I L I == 2 = N - RS B o N

(%)
—

()

Provisions: The Board of Appeals shall consist of five (5) members appointed
by the Board of County Commissioners. Terms shall be for three
(3) years. Vacancies shall be filled by appointment for the
unexpired term only.

Qualification: Members shall be qualified by experience and training to pass
upon pertinent matters. The members shall have the following
classifications:

1. Architectural — (application and design)

Q]

Engineering—{application and design)

(W3]

Residential Development/Construction
4. Advocacy for Community and Neighborhood Groups

5. Regulatory Compliance — (Inspection/Administration)

Meeting: The International Fire Code Board of Appeals meets when need

arises.

DONE this day of .2012.

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

- 074 P: 511

Revised on 09/11/2012 -m H\FJH'\‘FP‘:I Hf J Hﬁ F.H‘W,F‘l‘.‘i“ “‘H]M“:Fllaﬂi E\ m



[ S PN T NN ey

[ R P O R =T - - T T N

— —
~ o

18

R RS
LY [

L S T (S I 1
=R - SR R = A R -

L2 LY L) W ) b2
L 1D - D

L
=N

Q

That) /ijlw

Donald Hoihday, ‘Commissigner

Lawrence Romero, Commissioner

County Legal

Date:

Vo
saguﬁé% CIEE"HQ.? o Chrusrzal_

Date: [r-&gQQB L’;,gﬁli

f}r.‘ _<-"

-

;30 e 7
i £ B
dil"l . =2t
TLE ~ o
J',‘f" b \‘-,',-)
£ - R
B AN
((\ ., _;’. Q*\
A AT RS
L0 IS

B: 074 P: 512
B R TP P o PG

Revised on 09/11/2012



VALENCIA COUNTY
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
PAYROLL AUTHORIZATION

The attached computer printout lists all checks issued by the Managers Office on
January {4, 2013 covering payroll process on the above date.

Direct Deposit Check# 28592 through Direct Deposit Check # 28787 inclusive.
Deduction Check # 01 16676 through Deduction Check # 0116724 inclusive.
Payroll Check #94003 through Payroli Check # 94077 inclusive.

Listing total $.413.782.29

All have been reviewed for:

Appropriate documentation and approvals.
Authorized budget appropriations.
Compliance with New Mexico Statutes, and
DFA Rules and Regulations

.Jhb-l!\):—l

In recognition of the above, the Manager’s Office request this action be officially
recorded in the munutes of the regular County Commission meeting before which body
this matter came.

Recommended:

V7

Nick Telles, Finance Director

20645
Done this day of _January 2072
/‘
VALENCIA CO OARD OF COMMISSIONERS
Charles Eaton, Chair Alzcxa Anuzlar Vice Chair O
r—m@m’u }Ozﬂﬁ/vf-"\ é”//xﬂ/ ,/,_,,( 2 .
Dohald Holliday, Commissi{)ner Nﬁlry And’ersen Commissioner

7/ /\‘L i Exhibit |

»

OF’ NE;‘& -

. g74 P: 513
1l H}’JFHM‘,WGW‘H.{*P AT AR



VALENCIA COUNTY
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
1 ACCOUNTS PAYABLE AUTHORIZATION

E \{ The 'N’Bached computer printout lists all the checks issued by the Manager’s Office on
qq December 19, 2012 covering vendor bills processed on the above date.
Check # 116435 to 116543 inclusive, for the total of $868,163.75.

All have been reviewed for:

Appropriate documentation and approvals.
Authorized budget appropriations.
Compliance with New Mexico Statutes, and
. DFA Ruies and Regulations.

o N

In recognition of the above, the Fiscal Office requests this action be officially recorded in
the minutes of the reguiar county commission meeting before which body this matter
came.

Recommended:

7//3 PN

Nick Telies—Fmance Director

Done this 2}(d t day of _ January 2012, ZOID

9z

VALENCIA COUNTY BOARD OF CQ

M AWM/L

Donald E. Hokﬁlday Comimissioner

rles Eaton, Commi

/ 277 oy 7
(///.f/ ( / / ,/- l{;’L/ 2 S G
Lawrence R. Romero, Commissioner Mary J: ’Andersen Commissioner

& /,‘

Exhibit J

A f;F..?.-&-:l,ﬁﬁycm B: 074 P: 514
LI NE L M AL R K R, B



VALENCIA COUNTY
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
EL \ ACCOUNTS PAYABLE AUTHORIZATION

e s

The attached computer printout lists all the checks issued by the Manager’s Office on
December 31, 2012 covering vendor bills processed on the above date.
Check # 116582 to check # 116667 inclusive, for the total of $139,743.90.

All have been reviewed for:

Appropriate documentation and approvals.
Authorized budget appropriations.

. Compliance with New Mexico Statutes, and
DFA Rules and Regulations.

S S T N

In recognition of the above, the Fiscal Office requests this action be officially recorded in
the minutes of the regular county commission meeting before which body this matter
came.

Recommended:

"’:"7_,2/7{

NicK Telles-Finfric

5 24013
Done this 55 day of___ January 20427

/

VALENCIA COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

\(\fmw& Hmuz,i/] /%% 7 2

Donald E. Holliday, Commxssm Jer (CharlesFaton, Coﬁ‘l/ missioner

LaW"fence R. Romelo Commissioner Mary J/ A;ﬁérsen, Commissioner

Ub(‘u A 4 f/ Q\,V\,ﬂ

Alicia Aﬂﬁl ar, éé?nr, "

Exhibit K

o',;»";;'gd B: 074 P:. 515
| B P o ok, T R A, B



VALENCIA COUNTY
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
! l ACCOUNTS PAYABLE AUTHORIZATION
o\
o
\p EO(G]\{ The attached computer printout lists all the checks issued by the Manager’s Office on

December 20, 2012 covering vendor bills processed on the above date.
Check # 116544 inclusive, for the total of $4.604.90.

All have been reviewed for:

Appropriate documentation and approvals.
Authorized budget appropriations.
Compliance with New Mexico Statutes, and
DFA Rules and Regulfations.

W

In recognition of the above, the Fiscal Office requests this action be officially recorded in
the minutes of the regular county commission meeting before which body this matter
came.

Recommended:

7. )27

Nlc!{ Telles-Finance Director

Done this 2 t\:l/ day of  January 20-1?" Fold

VALENCIA COUNTY BOARD OF CQM

"D e L el L

Donald E. Holliday, Commissioner &hdrles Eaton, Commissmnex
v
,‘ /f(" X
( // £ 4 é/// /:M%
Lawrence R. Romero, Commissioner Nﬁuy Tﬁ-\ndersen Commissioner
e -
{‘ /

AE1c1a Aguilél C@ 1ssmner

-------

A . *
NS LT U U N ‘r 'f ’*_ -
v A

Exhibit L

B: 074 P: 516
I T T AR IR B 11




VALENCIA COUNTY
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
ACCOUNTS PAYABLE AUTHORIZATION

wa& )

w D‘S The attached computer puntout lists all the checks issued by the Manager’s Office on
January 14, 2013 covering vendor bills processed on the above date.
Check # 116725 to check # 116834 inclusive, for the total of $374.630.68.

All have been reviewed for;

Appropriate documentation and approvals.
Authorized budget appropriations.
Compliance with New Mexico Statutes, and
DFA Rules and Regulations.

B 1 e

In recognition of the above, the Fiscal Office requests this action be officially recorded in
the minutes of the regular county commission meeting before which body this matter
came.

Recommended:

07*—:74/¢_

Nick Telles-Finance Director

Done thls [ dayof —Eebrjame— 2013,
%@ Thaiv

VALENCIA COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

m@(nchmr %Q Luk% v }(M\p

Klicia Agmlar Vlce—ch;r’ )

Ol o
Donald E. Hohday, Commissioner Mary | /ﬁ]dmsen “Commissioner
/

Lawrenceﬁ le‘:nero Commissioner

ST
ATYEST: Exhibit M

: o

Corab & Clerk
a aJ . ler . .

P g B: 074 P: 517

¢ o’,;";;.'gs I o o T B ML P,



